0O

STATE OF OREGON = BUILDING CODES DIVISION

When energy-code
requirements are applicable
to nonresidential buildings

By Alan Seymour, Oregon Office of Energy

Oregon’s energy code requirements for
nonresidential buildings are contained in
Chapter 13 of the Oregon Structural Specialty
Code (OSSC). These requirements were
developed for buildings and spaces that are
conditioned by HVAC equipment, generally in-
stalled for human comfort. In order to accom-
modate
applications that do not require comfort condi-
tions associated with human occupancy, an
exception was created to protect wet sprinkler
systems from freezing. This exception
reduces requirements for building envelope
elements. The requirements of OSSC Section
1312, Exceptions 1 and 2:

¢ Maximum thermostat setpoint of 45° F
mounted no lower than the heating unit

* Roof/ceiling assembly, doors, and win-
dows shall comply with prescriptive en-
velope requirements (walls are excluded
from requirements)

» Heating capacity of heater not to exceed
15 btu/hr./ft.2for Climate Zone 1 (20 btu/
hr./ft.2for Climate Zone 2)

However, field experience shows
that sometimes building owners and operators
take advantage of these reduced require-
ments. They later convert the building to full

Please see “When energy-code requirements,” Page 2

MARCH/APRIL 2000

Dangerous products recalled..............
News from the administrators ...........
Administrative rules filed ..................

Staff advisories issued ................oo......

CABO One and Two Family Dwelling
Code and International One- and
Two-Family Dwelling Code lists

significant changes, 1995-1998 .........
Stakeholder meeting schedule...........

Prison construction code change ......

Manufactured structures

and parks Q & A ...ocovvveeeeee
Compliance Report ........cccccovevveenenn
Interpretive rulings signed.................
Interpretive rulings rescinded............

NOTICE e

New elevation certificate

phase-in period extended ..................

Board meeting dates ...........cccceeenen.

Subscription and address corrections

ANI'



When energy-code requirements, continued

comfort conditions with tremendous amounts
of energy and dollars wasted in the process.
This undermines the intent and spirit of the
energy-code requirements.

The 1996 OSSC was modified over prior
code to eliminate abuse of heating
uninsulated spaces. To eliminate this abuse,
the definition for “conditioned space” was
changed to capture this issue. It now states,
“Conditioned space is a space within a build-
ing envelope which is heated or cooled by an
HVAC system.”

Here are just a few examples of spaces
that are heated or cooled that are not for the
purpose of providing comfort:

» Spaces that are provided heat to meet
the standards specified in OSSC Section
1312, Exceptions 1 and 2 (semi-heated)

* A melt shop in a steel mill with a steel-
processing furnace

» A cold-storage plant

Whenever a HVAC system is installed in a
space within a new building or addition, it
must meet building envelope requirements
specified in OSSC Chapter 13. The latter two
examples describe “process” heating and
cooling equipment.

New buildings and additions

The building elements separating
conditioned spaces from semi-heated spaces
(walls, floors, or ceilings) must meet energy-
code requirements for exterior components
(OSSC Section 1312, Exceptions 1 and 2).
These “reduced” semi-heated building
envelope standards were created to save
energy and reduce heating costs.

The extreme heat generated by a steel-
processing furnace is not considered a HVAC
system. If a HVAC system is not installed in
a melt shop, the building envelope does
not need to comply with OSSC Section 1312,
Exterior Envelope or Section 1312, HVAC.

Conditions for maintaining a cold-storage
environment do not dictate that OSSC Sec-
tions 1312 and 1313 apply if a HVAC system
is not installed. The cooling plant is not de-
signed for comfort and is not required to be
tested for energy efficiency as stated in code.

Alterations and additions
an example

An existing building consists of a large,
open warehousing area and a small office.
The office is fully conditioned and has its own
HVAC systems. The heaters in open areas
have thermostats with a maximum setpoint of
55° F. The building was constructed before
1970 and does not have any building-enve-
lope insulation. A new tenant plans to use
the open area for manufacturing and to
install enough heating to provide comfort for
the workers.

Code citations: The last paragraph in
OSSC Section 1312.3.2 states: “The addition
of heating to an unconditioned space shall
require that the entire roof and one-half the
opaque wall area meet or exceed the
prescriptive path standards described in
Section 1312.2.1.”

Here lies the challenge. This code section
could conflict with the definition for condi-
tioned space. OSSC Section 1301.1.1, Alter-
ation and Repair, states: “Alterations or
repairs which affect components of existing
conditioned spaces regulated in this chapter
shall comply with this chapter.” The previous
sentence in this section states: “Alterations or
repairs affecting energy conservation mea-
sures shall conform to the requirements
specified in this chapter.”

The intent of energy-conservation require-
ments in code is to capture energy savings,
which also reduces operating costs. If a
nonresidential building is changing
occupancy without changing components



regulated by Chapter 13, no changes are re-
quired. If a nonresidential building is being al-
tered or repaired, only components affecting
energy conservation measures shall conform
to the requirements of Chapter 13. One of the
rare circumstances that requires improve-
ments (building-envelope insulation) is when
an unconditioned space is to be heated
(OSSC 1312.3.2). Since the semi-heated
space in an existing building is not heated for
comfort, the addition of heat should require
standards specified in OSSC Section
1312.3.2.

If the space in the example cited was not
a heated space, OSSC Section 1312.3.2
would clearly be applicable.

The applicant must apply for a mechanical
permit for conditions described in this article.
Does the mechanical permit application ask
the question: “Is a HVAC system being in-
stalled in a space that is currently heated or
cooled for human comfort?”

Ancillary issues

Windows located in a wall separating
conditioned from semi-heated spaces:

There are two separate requirements for
exterior windows in non-residential buildings:
U-factor and shading coefficient (SC). It
would be reasonable to not apply SC for win-
dows in walls separating conditioned from
semi-heated spaces. There is no solar inci-
dence in the enclosed semi-heated space. Win-
dow U-factor requirements are still applicable.

Radiant heaters are often installed to
provide human comfort in large unconditioned
spaces. Radiant heaters are considered
HVAC equipment and do not exempt required
building-envelope insulation.

Questions regarding nonresidential or
residential energy-code applications may be
directed to Alan Seymour, Oregon Office of
Energy, (503) 378-5873. m

Dangerous products recalled

Al

The manufacturers and distributors of the
following items are cooperating with the U. S.
Consumer Product Safety Commission in
their recall efforts.

Dishwashers recalled. General Electric
is recalling 3.1 million GE and Hotpoint dish-
washers manufactured between April 1983
and January 1989. The dishwashers have a
slide switch to select heat-drying and energy-
saver functions. Over time, the slide switch
can melt and ignite, presenting a fire hazard.

Models being recalled are GSD500D,
GSD500G, GSD540, HDA467, HDAA477, or
HDA487 with a serial number with a second
letter of A, M, R, S, T, V, or Z (such as
BM12345). The numbers are located on a
label on the right or left front edge of the
inner tub.

Consumers should stop using these
appliances and keep the door open to pre-
vent current from reaching the slide switch.
Call (800) 599-2929 or visit
www.geappliancerecall.com
about GE’s rebate program.

for details

Work lights recalled. New Buffalo Corp.
is recalling 2,800 Buffalo fluorescent work
lights, which are 16-inch fluorescent tube
lights with hangers for use in awkward loca-
tions. These lights have model number PL-16
on the packaging. The fixture is 19 /2 inches
long with yellow plastic caps on the ends. It
has a yellow cord and two S-hook hangers.

These lights may have undersized wiring
and exposed electrical parts on the plug that
pose a shock and fire hazard. Consumers
should stop using these lights and return them

Please see “Dangerous products recalled,” Page 22

3



News from the administrators

by Joe Brewer and Joan Fraser

Master builder pilot program under way
As a result of 1997 legislation, a pilot pro-
gram certifying “master builders” in Marion
County is under way. Marion County, the City
of Salem, the Oregon Building Industry Asso-
ciation and the Building Codes Division are
working cooperatively on a program that
allows one- and two-family builders who work
in the Marion County area to sit for a division-
administered examination after receiving
training in specific areas of the code.
Builders who pass the examination are then
“approved” by the building official in one of the
pilot area jurisdictions. The builder may forego
certain inspections normally conducted by the
jurisdiction. So far, the pilot is enjoying some
success. Three groups of 12 contractors have
been trained and tested; most have passed
the examination. The results of this pilot pro-
gram will be reported to the next legislature.
The next legislative assembly will decide if
this pilot program should be staffed and
implemented statewide.

Master plan review by BCD an option.
The Building Codes Division has had the
ability for some time to provide plan review
services for any structure being built in Or-
egon at the builder’s option. The law allows
local jurisdictions to recover reasonable fees
for review of site-specific work not covered by
the division’s plan review. The division has not
marketed this service widely, following a
policy to not compete with other service pro-
viders or jurisdictions. Until recently, only state
agencies and a few structures intended for
construction in multiple jurisdictions have
used this service. However, the division has
received several inquiries about the service
and how it works. If requested, the service will
be provided with an emphasis on keeping the
local jurisdiction involved at every step. Ques-
tions about master plan review should be
directed to Etta Foote, (503) 373-1983.

Tri-County Building Industry

Service Board meets

The 1999 legislature passed SB 512,
which created the Tri-county Industry Service
Board and Center. The purpose of the center
is to develop uniform practices and proce-
dures for all building departments in
Multnomah, Clackamas, and Washington
counties.

The first meeting of the board was
December 16, 1999. Lisa Naito was elected
chair of the board in absentia. Terry Dieter
was elected co-chair and did an able job
leading the first meeting. After an overview of
the Building Codes Division and how the
board interfaces with the division, the board
appointed committees to work on the minor
label program, fee-setting criteria, and pro-
cess and forms. Members of the board volun-
teered for the various committee activities
and demonstrated a strong desire to get to
the detalils.

Joan Stevens-Schwenger, the manager of
public information and technical services to
employers’ programs at the Bureau of Labor
and Industries, has been appointed by Joe
Brewer to a one-year job rotation as the man-
ager of the center. Joining Joan will be Greg
Carlson from the City of Portland. Greg will
also be on a job rotation.

First meeting held on Senate Bill 587

SB 587 charges the division with licensing
private providers of plan review and inspec-
tion services. In addition, the bill establishes
timelines for plan review completion, expands
the concept of chief inspector beyond the tra-
ditional plumbing and electrical programs,
and clarifies the division’s ability to collect
fees on hourly inspection activities. The bill is
effective July 1, 2000, and authorizes the divi-
sion to adopt rules on all of these issues.



Division representatives met with Oregon
Building Officials Association, the group’s at-
torney, and Mike Greenfield, DCBS director.
The group presented its questions and con-
cerns and requested that Allan Clair, Clair
Company, and Stephen Winstead, Carl Mileff
& Associates, serve as representatives during
the rule-making process. Specific questions
were raised about additional costs and the
scope of activities allowed under the new li-
cense. Director Greenfield indicated that the
answers to their questions would be deter-
mined through the rule-making process.

Following is a summary of SB 587: Dedi-
cation and commingling of building depart-
ment revenues, third-party services, timelines,
and appeals:

Dedication and commingling of building
department revenues

» Local jurisdictions may adopt by ordi-
nance or regulation necessary and rea-
sonable fees for any specialty code or
codes administered by the jurisdiction.

* Fees must be used for the administration
and enforcement of a building inspection
program, but jurisdictions are not re-
guired to have separate specialty code
accounting. (However, please note that
revenue and expenses for each specialty
code should be tracked to justify fee
increases.)

* Fee revenues may be co-mingled in a
building inspection program, except for
revenues from electrical fees, which still
must be kept separate.

Third-party services

* The Department of Consumer and
Business Services (DCBS - the depart-
ment where the Building Codes Division
resides) is directed to establish a licens-
ing system for third-party individuals per-
forming plan reviews or inspections.

* Employees of the state or a municipality
are exempt from the licensure require-
ments. Special inspectors and prefabri-

cated structure plan reviewers and in-
spectors also are exempt from the new
licensing process.

» Local jurisdictions and BCD must allow
applicants to contract with a third-party
plan reviewer if certain timelines cannot
be met. Jurisdictions must designate at
least three licensees from whom plan re-
views will be accepted. They may estab-
lish the process for collection of plan
review fees from third-party licensees.
The amount of third-party fees is not
regulated. Jurisdictions may collect rea-
sonable administrative fees. Personal
service contracts between a jurisdiction
and a licensee are exempt from contract
provisions of ORS 279.005 to 279.111.

» Local jurisdictions are not required to
accept a plan review or inspection of a
third party if it does not meet the require-
ments of the state building code. A juris-
diction accepting a third-party plan
review or inspection will have no respon-
sibility or liability for the activities of
a licensee.

Timelines

e In jurisdictions with populations of less
than 300,000, “simple” (to be defined)
one- and two-family dwelling plans must
be approved or disapproved within 10
business days of receiving a complete
application. In jurisdictions with a popu-
lation of more than 300,000, the timeline
is 15 business days.

* The timelines only apply to the building
department review. The timeline does
not apply if the plan is for a complex
structure that requires additional review
as determined by BCD or the municipal-
ity, or if a different plan review schedule
is authorized in the jurisdiction’s local
operating plan.

« A process for specialty code plan re-
views of commercial structures must be
included in operating plans.

Please see “News from the adminstrators,” Page 6

5



News from the administrators, continued

{ 4
TH

Ap

A jurisdiction that repeatedly fails to meet
the plan review deadlines shall be con-
sidered to be engaging in a pattern of
conduct failing to provide timely plan re-
views. BCD may assume a jurisdiction’s
program for failure to comply with the
provisions of the bill.

peals

Decisions of local building officials may
be appealed to specialty code chief in-
spectors at BCD. The appeal is to be
made to the appropriate specialty code
chief inspector. (Greater consistency in
interpretations of codes is expected with
the creation of specialty code chief
inspector positions, which have only
been used for plumbing and electrical
codes in the past.) The decision of the
chief inspector may be appealed to the
appropriate advisory board. A board’s
decision may be appealed to the director
of DCBS only if codes in addition to the
applicable specialty code are at issue.

If the appropriate advisory board deter-
mines that a decision by the chief in-
spector is a major code interpretation,
then the decision shall be distributed to
all applicable specialty code public and
private inspection authorities within 60
days of the board’s determination.

If an appeal is made, the plan review
deadline is to be extended by the num-
ber of days it takes for a final decision to
be issued for the appeal.

A series of seven workshops were held
around the state to share information on the
impacts of the dedicated revenue portion of
the new statute. The workshops were spon-
sored by the League of Oregon Cities, the
Oregon Building Officials Association, and the
Building Codes Division.

Interim review of Oregon’s building

regulatory process

In July 1999, BCD conducted an internal
review of its processes and organizational
structure. One of the findings was that the
compliance process did not appear to be
meeting the needs of industry, stakeholders,
or of BCD inspection staff. In October, a se-
ries of meetings were held around the state to
gather input on improving Oregon’s “system”
for regulating construction. The input from
these meetings confirmed the division’s prior
finding.

As a result, the division’s Regulatory Ser-
vices staff is proposing radical changes to the
current process. A draft of this proposal was
shared with stakeholders, our boards, and the
Central Oregon International Conference of
Building Officials (ICBO) Chapter. The pro-
posal was also shared with the steering com-
mittee that was formed as a result of the
stakeholder meetings.

Our goal is to significantly shorten the
time frame between violation and outcome
and to prioritize our efforts so the division can
focus attention on repeat violators. We hope
to include a more active role for our partner
jurisdictions around the state. If you are inter-
ested in more details, contact us through our
Web site or call (503) 378-3176.

Please see “News from the adminstrators,” Page 7



News from the administrators, continued

9

-

Cross-training for one- and two-

family electrical inspectors

The National Electrical Contractors Asso-
ciation (NECA), the International Brotherhood
of Electrical Workers (IBEW), the Oregon
Building Officials Association (OBOA), and the
Building Codes Division (BCD) are discussing
joint development of training for one- and
two-family dwelling electrical inspectors. For
some time now, it has been possible for
jurisdictions to develop cross-training pro-
grams for dwelling inspectors. OBOA devel-
oped and offered a successful program for
cross-training as one- and two-family dwelling
plumbing inspectors.

This is the first time that business, labor,
and government have come together to de-
velop such a program in partnership. Discus-
sions have been positive, with all parties
expressing interest in developing a suitable
training program.

Electrical and mechanical

board- consolidation task group

Senate Bill 803 from last session calls for a
task group to study the benefits and drawbacks
of creating a “super board” at BCD. This board
would replace the Electrical and Elevator,
Boiler, and Plumbing boards and portions of the
Building Codes Structures Board. The super
board would have many of the responsibilities
of the current boards but would accomplish its
work through technical subcommittees. The
task group will be made up of four members
from each of the boards and one member ap-
pointed at large. The governor will appoint all
members of the task group. A report on the ef-
forts of this group will be provided to the legisla-
ture by January 31, 2001. ®

Administrative rules filed

S
A

Permanent rules have been filed adopting the
following:

» Electrical equivalent experience criteria
effective January 1

* Permit fee clarification for limited energy
circuits effective January 1

» Converting a temporary rule establishing
Tri-County Industry Service Board sur-
charge effective January 1

* The 1999 National Electrical Code with
Oregon amendments (Oregon Electrical
Specialty Code) to be effective April 1

e The 1998 International One- and Two-
Family Dwelling Code with Oregon
amendments (Oregon One- and Two-
Family Dwelling Specialty Code) to be
effective April 1

« Converting a temporary rule on certain
alternative code provisions for prison
construction effective April 1 (See re-
lated article Page 15.)

Copies of these rules were mailed to all
building officials. They can also be viewed on
the Web at: http://arcweb.sos.state.or.us. m



Staff advisories 1ssued

The Technical Advisory Group recently issued

the following advisory interpretations:
Program: Electrical

Combination motor controllers
installed above suspended ceilings

Subject:

Source: 1996 edition of the National
Electrical Code
References: Sections 380-8(a) and

430.81(a)

Date of issue: January 3, 2000

Prepared by: Gary A. Wilson
Chief electrical inspector
(503) 373-7509

Question: Can combination motor controllers
be installed above suspended ceilings?

Determination: No. Combination motor con-
trollers, where not adjacent to equipment that
they supply, shall not be installed above sus-
pended ceilings.

Analysis: Combination motor controllers usu-
ally consist of a magnetic relay and either a
circuit breaker or a fused switch. The switch-
ing mechanism is external; some may contain
a transformer for motor-control circuitry. They
are defined in Section 430-81(a) as a switch
or device normally used to start and stop

a motor by making and breaking the

motor circulit.

Article 380 applies to all switches, switch-
ing devices, and circuit breakers that are used
as switches. This includes combination motor
controllers. Section 380-8(a) requires them to
be located that they may be operated from a
readily accessible place, and be installed so
that the center of the operating handle in its
highest position shall not be more than 6 feet
7 inches above the floor or working platform.
A combination motor controller solely installed
above a suspended ceiling is not acceptable.

Section 380-8(a), Exception 2, allows
switches to be higher than 6 feet 7 inches
where installed adjacent to motors, appli-
ances, or other equipment that they supply.
They must be accessible by portable means.
It is acceptable to install a combination motor
controller above a suspended ceiling where it
will be adjacent to the equipment it controls.

Program: Structural

Subject:  Licensed engineer or architect
requirements in general and for

design of “significant structures”

Source: 1998 Oregon Structural Specialty
Code (OSSC), 1999 House Bill

3144 and Senate Bill 1117

Reference: OSSC Section 106.3.2, ORS
671.030 and 672.002 to

672.325

Date of issue: December 21, 1999 (Revisied
February 14, 2000)

Prepared by: Ravindra K. Mahajan
Facilities engineer
(503) 373-1354

Questions:

1. When the drawings for plan review are
not required to be prepared by a li-
censed architect or engineer per OSSC
Section 106.3.2, can someone who is
not licensed by the state of Oregon as
an engineer or architect provide compu-
tations in support of the plans and/or
specifications?

2. What is the definition of “significant
structures” and what are the require-
ments for design and plans preparation
for such structures?

Determination: Question 1 . Design by an
unlicensed individual is acceptable on exempt
buildings, but the engineering calculations
done on exempt structures must be done by
a professional engineer licensed by the



Oregon State Board of Engineers, unless the
information provided is based on tables,
graphs, and computer programs that do not
require engineering skills.

Question 2 . “Significant structures” are de-
fined as follows:

» Hazardous facilities and special occu-
pancy structures (per ORS 455.447)

+ Essential facilities of more than 4,000
square feet and/or more than 20 feet in
height

* Buildings customarily occupied by hu-
man beings and more than four stories
or 45 feet in height above average
ground level

e Structures having irregular features as
determined by the director of DCBS

Engineers licensed by the Oregon Board
of Engineers to practice structural engineering
are required to provide engineering design
services for significant structures.

Analysis:

Question 1 . OSSC 106.3.2, existing archi-
tects’ law, and the existing engineers’ law (as
amended by 1999 Senate Bill 1117) provide
exemptions from the design requirements for
single-family residences, farm buildings, and
other structures less than 20 feet in height
and less than 4,000 square feet in ground
area. Previous to passage of SB 1117, the en-
gineers’ law did not contain the exemptions
for these structures. The recent legislative
amendments to the engineers’ law brought its
statutes in line with the architects’ law, OSSC
requirements, and the state attorney general’s
July 29, 1999, opinion on this issue. The ex-
emptions apply to all persons for the types of
buildings listed for all design, planning, speci-
fications, supervision of erection, enlarge-
ment, and alteration of them. The persons
engaged in those activities need not be state-
registered architects or engineers.

None of the above laws exempt engineer-
ing calculations for the exempted structures.
When a building official requires engineering

calculations on the design of exempted struc-
tures, a determination needs to be made
whether the submitted information is obtained
from industry standards, tables, graphs, etc.,
or it is derived by using engineering knowl-
edge or skills. Information obtained from the
industry standards, tables, graphs, etc., is not
considered requiring any technical skill or cal-
culations and are acceptable to be provided
by the designers of exempt structures. The
Board of Examiners for Engineering and Land
Surveying published its opinion on this issue
in its February 1999 newsletter. The relevant
portions are reproduced here:

“... selecting structural members or com-
ponents of a building does not always require
a professional engineer or an architect. There
are numerous tables, graphs, computer pro-
grams etc., that are listed in the building code
or in ICBO reports that require modest techni-
cal skills to select an item but do not require a
PE'’s special talent. In the structural field,
those modest technical skills include being
able to select an element span, spacing and
load. From this information, a non-licensed
person can make a selection without doing
any calculations from the numerous publica-
tions/programs, codes, manufacturers’ data
etc. These types of selections are really a
‘prescriptive approach.” Embedded in the
tables, programs, etc., is the use of engineer-
ing skills and calculations, but these skills are
blind or hidden to the user. The use of tables,
graphs and computer programs that lead to a
prescriptive selection is not engineering.”

Based on the above, information submit-
ted for exempted structures based on the use
of tables, graphs, and programs that provide
prescriptive results is acceptable. Data or cal-
culations for any structure requiring the use of
engineering skills, etc., must be done by an
engineer registered by the Oregon Board of
Engineers.

Question 2. Structural Engineering Associa-
tion of Oregon (SEAQ) sponsored House Bill

Please see “Staff advisories,” Back cover

9



CABO One and Two Family

Dwelling Code and

International One- and Two-

Family Dwelling Code list

significant changes, 1995-1998

10

The following summary of revisions re-
flects significant changes made to the 1995
CABO One and Two Family Dwelling Code
that appear in the 1998 International
One- and Two-Family Dwelling Code. The list
is provided as a convenience to code
users and is not intended to be inclusive
of all revisions and does not include
Oregon amendments. The summary must
be compared to actual revised text to deter-
mine the full meaning of each revision.
Questions should be directed to Mike Ewert,
(503) 373-7529.

CHAPTER 1

ADMINISTRATION

*105.1 Gives the building official or his agent
the right to enter premises where a violation
or unsafe condition exists.

*106.2 Changes the term “city” to include all
jurisdictions.

*111.2 Permit Application: New.
*111.3 Information Required: New.

*111.4 Provides for more than one permit ex-
tension of 90 days.

*111.5 Permit Fees: Section 111.2 in ‘95.

*112.1 Adds the provisions for the design
loads to be clearly indicated on the plans.

*113.1.4 (95 CABO): Deleted.

*113.1.4.1 Fire resistive construction inspec-
tion: Added.

Internutionm\

On\e- and

thl- an‘u\y
Dw\\e\ling

CABO
ONE and TWO
FAMILY
DWELLING COPE

4905 EDMON

CHAPTER 2
BUILDING DEFINITIONS

*201.1 Indicates that other definitions are
located in other chapters of the code.

*Solid Masonry: The definition no longer
references ASTM C- 145.

CHAPTER 3
BUILDING PLANNING

*301.1 Design: Indicates that unconventional
structural elements are used and that they
should be designed within accepted engi-
neering practices.

*301.4 Section for elevated garage floors
relocated to Table 301.4, footnote c.

*303.3 Bathrooms: Changes the ventilation
requirements.

*303.4 Stairway lllumination: Deleted light in-
tensity requirements.

*305.1 Minimum Ceiling Height: Changed
from 7 feet 6 inches to 7 feet.

*308.1.2 Identification of Multiple Assemblies:
Added.

*308.4 Hazardous Locations (Glazing) #5:
60 inches above “any standing or walking
surface.”



*308.4 Hazardous Locations (Glazing) #9:
Changes the distance of glazing and where
the distance is measured from to be consid-
ered hazardous location around pools.

*308-6.2 Permitted Materials (Skylights and
sloped (glazing): Limits the size of laminated
glass by thickness.

*310.2 Window Wells: Added.
*310.2.1 Ladders and Steps: Added.

*310.3 Bars, Grills, Covers, and Screens:
Added for window wells.

*312.1 General (Landings) Exception #2:
Changes the maximum dimension from top of
threshold to landing at an exterior doorway.

*314.2.1 Profile (Stairways): Makes reference
to open risers and openings.

*314.6 Circular Stairways: Reflects changes
in tread dimensions.

*315.1 Handrails: Covers new handrail height
requirements.

*316.1.1 Alteration Repairs and Additions:
Creates new exception taken from the body of
the Code.

*316.2 Power Source: Restates the usage of
battery operated smoke detectors in buildings.

*317.5 Termite Damage (Foam Plastic): New.
*319.1 Insulation Exception #2: New.

*319.2 Loose Fill Insulation: The test for
flame spread is no longer year specific.

*319.2 Continued: New exception.
*319.3 Cellulose Loose-Fill Insulation: New.

*320.2 Townhouses (Dwelling Unit Separa-
tion) Exception: New requirement for outlet
boxes in rated walls.

*322.1 Location Required (Protection Against
Decay): Deletes C-20 as one of the AWPA
listed standards.

*322.2.1 Required Information Exception:
New requirements for labeling of pressure
treated lumber.

*323.4 Foam Plastic Protection (Protection
against Termites): New.

*325.1 Premise Identification (Site Address):
New.

CHAPTER 4

FOUNDATIONS

*402.1 Wood Treatment (Materials): Change
in standards for treatment and treatment for
cutting and drilling.

*402.2 Concrete: Changes the proportions of
concrete and admixtures.

*403.1.4 Foundation Anchorage (Footings):
Specifies the anchorage of interior wood sole
plates and cold-formed-steel framing sys-
tems.

*403.1.5 Seismic Reinforcing: Specifies the
requirements for footing reinforcement in
Seismic Zone 4.

*403.3 Insulated Footings: New for 1998,
specifies the monthly mean temperature in a
building be maintained at 64 degrees F.
States that no portion of the slab on ground
using the frost-protected foundation will be lo-
cated under unheated spaces.

*403.3.1 Termite Damage: New.

*403.3.2 Protection of Horizontal Below-
Ground Insulation: New.

*403.3.3 Drainage: New.

*404.1 Concrete and Masonry Foundation
Walls (Foundation Walls): Adds ACI 318 and
NCMA 68-A as new standards for engineered
designs.

Please see “Code changes,” Page 12

11



Code changes, continued

12

*404.1.4 Seismic Zones 3 and 4: A change in
the requirement of deleted 95 CABO Table
404.1.1b.

*404.1.7 Backfill Placement Exception:
Changes the height of unbalanced fill not re-
quiring bracing from 3 feet in the 1995 CABO
to 4 feet.

*404.1.8 Rubble Stone Masonry: Require-
ments formerly in CABO Table 404.1.1a.

*404.3 Wood Sill Plates (Wood Foundation
Walls) Specifies that wood sill plates be a
minimum of 2" x 4"s.

CHAPTER 5

FLOORS

*502.1 General (Floor Framing) Standards for
dimension lumber are no longer year-specific.

*502.1.1 Preservation Treated Lumber: states
that the accreditation body shall comply with
the requirements of the ALCS.

*502.1.3 End Jointed Lumber: Restates that
end jointed lumber must meet the same re-
quirements as other dimension lumber.

*502.3.1 Lumber Design Values (Allowable
Spans) Gives the requirements for floor joist
loads and deletes the reference to repetitive
members (1995 CABO).

*502.3.2.1 Sleeping Areas and Attic Joists:
Makes minimum pounds per square foot re-
quirements for attics with a fixed stairway.

*502.6.1 Sawn Lumber (Drilling and Notch-
ing): Gives criteria for the location of a hole in
reference to a notch and deletes the part of
the 1995 CABO that address cantilevered
joists.

*502.6.2 Engineered Wood Products: New.

*502. 10 (changed to 502.9) Floor Trusses:
Deletes all references to standards
except TPI.

*Table 503.1 Minimum Thickness of Lumber
Floor Sheathing: Changes to fiber bending
and the modulus of elasticity in the footnotes.

*503.2 Plywood sheathing change to wood
structural panel sheathing

*503.2.1 Identification and Grade: Deletes
reference to ANSI HP as a standard and
includes the Canadian standard CSA 0437.

*503.2.3 Installation: Includes cold-formed-
steel framing.

*506 Steel Floor Framing: New.

CHAPTER 6

WALL CONSTRUCTION
*602.1.1 End Jointed Lumber (Identification)
Interchangeably.

*602.3.2 Stud Spacing: New tables taking into
consideration seismic and wind loads.

*602.9.1 Bracing (Cripple Walls) added state-
ment to clarify that sheathing need only be
installed on 1 side if that is specified in

the design.

*603 Steel Wall Framing: New.

*604.2.4 Parapet Walls (General Masonry
Construction) Takes wind loads into consider-
ation.

*604.11 Reinforcement: Gives the require-
ments for seismic and wind load areas.

*604.14 Metal Accessories: Denotes that
ASTM A 951 is the appropriate standard for
joint reinforcement.

*605.1 Mortar (Unit Masonry) Gives stan-
dards and requirement considerations for
both building location and seismic areas.

*606 Glass Unit Masonry: New section
for 1998.

*608.1.1 Grout (Grouted Masonry) Deletes
references to mortar in section 607.1.1 of the
1995 CABO.



CHAPTER 7

WALL COVERING

*702.2.1 Support (Interior Plaster): Adds to
the requirements for the installation of
gypsum lath.

*702.3.1 Materials: Adds ASTM C 79 and C
630 to the standards for gypsum board mate-
rials and accessories.

*702.3.4 Application: States requirements for
attaching gypsum sheathing to exterior walls.

*702.3.5 Fastening: Now requires that type

S screws penetrate steel framing members a
minimum of 3/g" instead of /4," as stated in the
1995 CABO.

*702.4.2 Gypsum Backer: Gives the thickness
and spacing for water-resistant board when
attached to a ceiling.

*702.5 Other Finishes: Gives requirements
for the installation of wood veneer or hard-
board paneling.

*702.6 Wood Shakes and Shingles: If con-
forming to CSSB, wood shakes and shingles
shall be permitted to be directly installed to
the studs spaced 24 inches on center.

*703.3 Wood, Plywood, and Wood Structural
Panel Siding: Addresses horizontal joint treat-
ment.

*Table 703.4 Footnote “J”: Specifies stud
spacing in relation to panel span rating. Foot-
note “O” states that 3/8" particleboard may not
be used as siding.

*703.6.2 Plaster: New.

*703.7 Masonry Veneer, General: Gives
changes made to the height requirements.

*703.7 Exception #2: States requirements for
cold-formed-steel framing.

*703.7.2 Anchorage: Gives requirements for
the anchoring of masonry veneer.

*703.7.2.1 Size and Spacing: Veneer tie re-
quirements.

*703.7.2.1.1 Seismic Zones 3 and 4: Continu-
ation of veneer tie requirements and new for
1998 veneer ties around wall openings.

*703.7.2 Paper Backing Required.
*703.7.2.3 Mortar or Grout Fill.

CHAPTER 8
ROOF-CEILING CONSTRUCTION

*802.4 Allowable Spans: Now includes steel
framing.

*802.4.1 Design load duration for ceiling joists
and rafters.

*802.6.1 Sawn Lumber (Cutting and Notch-
ing): Specifies hole location in reference to
the location of any notches.

*802.6.2 Engineered Wood Products: New.

*802.5 Bearing Changed to Load-Bearing.
Added requirement for bearing on concrete.

*802.9.1 Truss Live Loads: New.
*802.9.2 Truss Dead Loads: New.

*802.10 Trusses: Specifies only one standard
for 1998.

*802.10 Roof Tie-Down and Table 802.10
Gives new rule for wind uplift forces.

*803-2.1 Identification and Grade (Wood
Structural Panel Sheathing): Plywood and
wood structural panels - same in 1998.

*804 Steel Roof Framing: New.

*808 Insulation Clearance: New.

Please see “Code changes,” Page 14

13



Code changes, continued

i

Stakeholder meeting schedule

14

CHAPTER 9

ROOF COVERINGS
*903 Asphalt Shingles: Reworked and Relo-
cated for 1998.

*903.8 Hips and Ridges (1995 CABO): First
sentence deleted for 1998. Second sentence
relocated to Table 903. 1.

CHAPTER 10

CHIMNEYS AND FIREPLACES
*1001.4 Offsets: New.

*1001.8.1 Residential-type Appliance (Gen-
eral) & Flue Lining (Materials): Flue lining sys-
tems specified and some added and deleted.

*1001.9.2 Space Around Lining: Exclusive for
the flue or vent.

*1001.12 Flue Area (Masonry Fireplace):
Sized under new requirements and tables.

*1001.14 Masonry Chimney Clean-out Open-
ings: Adds additional requirements for the
location of clean-outs.

*1003.3.1 Vertical Reinforcement (Seismic
Reinforcement): New.

*1003.4.1 Anchorage (Seismic Anchorage):
New.

*1003.5 Fireplace Walls: Specifies width of
joints between firebrick and the firebrick
standard.

*Table 1003. 1: Show additions for 1998.

*1003.7 Lintel and Throat: Gives location of
the throat or damper.

*1003.8 Smoke Chamber: New.

*1003.8.1 Smoke Chamber Dimensions:
New.

*1003.11 Firebox Dimensions: Gives new
requirements for the throat, damper, and
smoke chamber.

*1003.11 Exception: New.

*1006.2 Exterior Air Intake (Exterior Air Sup-
ply): Gives new requirements for location of
the intake.

*1006.3 Clearance: New. &

Stakeholder meetings are open-forum
meetings to discuss questions or concerns
related to building codes programs. Joe
Brewer, administrator, and Etta Foote, field
operations manager, will discuss your ques-
tions or concerns about the programs ser-
viced by the state. Following is the tentative
schedule for the remainder of 2000. Each
area will be notified of specific dates, times,
and locations through mailings and notices in
local newspapers.

March — Clatsop County

April — Lake and Curry counties

May — Wasco County

June — Grant and Morrow counties
August — Coos and Lane counties
September — Douglas County

October — Wallowa and Umatilla counties

November — Jefferson and Crook counties



Prison construction code change

~

S

y

A new OSSC Appendix Chapter 3 for de-
tention and correctional facilities was imple-
mented by temporary rule effective November
1, 1999, and will be converted to permanent
rule April 1. The approval by the Building
Codes Structures Board and the division ad-
ministrator followed a consensus process us-
ing a work group of local building officials (one
of whom was an engineer), fire officials, De-
partment of Corrections representatives,
prison design consultants, builders, Disabili-
ties Commission representatives, and BCD.
The appendix chapter language was devel-
oped from the National Fire Protection Asso-
ciation Standard 101 and the International
Building Code.

The reasons for the change included the
need to provide up-to-date standards consis-
tent with unique corrections operations and
current detention-facility construction meth-
ods, to incorporate provisions that have been
permitted in other nationally recognized stan-
dards and to develop appropriate standards
that protect life safety and reduce costs.

The code change was originally filed as
a temporary rule, in response to a legislative
mandate requiring construction of new pris-
ons, so that that updated codes could be used
for designs in process. The previous code
contained inadequate provisions to address

prison construction. The new language in-
creases the allowable area for detention
facilities based on improved types of protec-
tion and security, and fire safety history of
metal and wood frame corrections facilities in
Oregon and across the country.

Copies of the rule and new code lan-
guage were mailed to building officials.

Two sections need further clarification:
OSSC Section 308.2.2.2 limits floor surfaces
to noncombustible materials in rooms occu-
pied by inmates or patients whose personal
liberties are restrained. The intent of this sec-
tion, as in past editions of the OSSC, is to
limit the floors in cells and cell dormitories
where prisoners or patients are restrained to
non combustible surfaces. However, areas
such as counseling offices, libraries, recre-
ation spaces, and day rooms where prisoners
are under supervision and can move away
from a fire may have carpeting or linoleum
with Class Il flame spread. The intent of
Appendix Section 323.1 is to allow glazing
greater than 25 percent in corridor walls and in
smoke barrier walls, provided a single window
does not exceed the limit of 84 square feet and
neither width nor height exceed 12 feet.

This is allowed in order to provide necessary
security. ®

15



Manufactured structures and parks Q & A

By Patrick Lewis - Polijcy and Technical

16

Services Section

Question

One of our most frequently asked ques-
tions: Are ventless gas room heaters and fire-
places permitted in manufactured dwellings?

Answer

The 1997 Oregon Manufactured Dwelling
Standard (OMDS), Section 1101(e) requires
heat-producing appliances other than ranges,
dryers, furnaces, and water heaters to be
listed and approved for manufactured-home
use. Gas-burning heating appliances are
required to be listed to UL 307B-First Edition-
1982 With Revision May 18, 1987. UL 307B
not only requires gas-burning heating appli-
ances to be vented but also requires them to
be sealed-combustion appliances. Because
ventless gas room heaters or fireplaces can-
not meet this standard, they are not permitted
in manufactured dwellings.

As a result of the last Manufactured struc-
tures and parks question and answers column
on park trailers published in the January/Feb-
ruary 2000 CodeLink, new questions have
arisen on this subject.

Question

Can | build a deck under an awning next
to my park trailer and enclose it without it be-
coming a cabana?

Answer

No. Oregon Revised Statute (ORS)
446.003 permits awnings to be enclosed on
one side only. The same statute defines a
cabana as a structure with two or more walls
used adjacent to and in conjunction with the
park trailer to provide additional living space.
What is described meets the definition of a
cabana, and would have to be constructed
accordingly and be subject to the maximum
combined-size restrictions of 400 square feet.

Question

Can | build an unheated and noninsulated
addition without electrical outlets to the side
of a park trailer so that it is an enclosed patio
rather than a cabana?

Answer

No. ORS 446.003 does not permit cov-
ered patios adjacent to park trailers to be en-
closed; therefore, this would still be a cabana.
However, without heat, insulation, or electrical
outlets, the cabana would not be in compli-
ance with the Oregon One and Two Family
Dwelling Specialty Code, as required.

Question

Because cabanas must meet require-
ments of the Oregon One and Two Family
Dwelling Specialty Code, | can add a room
adjacent to a park trailer and not build it to the
Oregon One and Two Family Dwelling Spe-
cialty Code, and it would no longer be a ca-
bana, right?

Answer

No. It would still be a cabana, because it's
enclosed. It would just be a cabana out of
compliance with the Oregon One and Two
Family Dwelling Specialty Code. Building a
structure that does not meet code does not
make it exempt from the code.

Question

Why is there so much disparity in the laws
and regulations between park trailers and
manufactured dwellings?

Answer

Neither state nor federal laws ever in-
tended to treat these two structures in the
same manner. Each has a separate and dis-
tinct purpose. They are not meant to be inter-
changeable. Manufactured dwellings are
intended to be permanent full-time resi-
dences; park trailers are intended for recre-
ational, seasonal, or emergency use.



Consider the following differences:

Park trailers are constructed and
intended to be used as recreational
vehicles; manufactured dwellings are
constructed and intended to be used as
single-family dwellings.

Park trailers are built to the minimal
American National Standard Institute
(ANSI) A119.5 Standard for Recreational
Park Trailers, while manufactured homes
are built to the much more stringent fed-
eral Manufactured Home Construction
and Safety Standards.

Manufactured dwellings are unlimited in
size or the number of additions while
park trailers are limited to a maximum of
400 square feet excluding lofts and cov-
ered porches.

Park trailers are limited to a single
chassis mounted on wheels; manufac-
tured dwellings can have multiple chas-
sis and have the wheels and axles
removed.

Manufactured dwellings are required to
be installed to a very stringent installa-

tion standard that provides a foundation
system capable of lasting the life of the

home; park trailers are installed to a
minimal installation standard designed
for temporary placement.

Because of the park trailer’s mobility and
temporary use, it is permitted in recre-
ational areas, in forest lands, outside ur-
ban growth boundaries, and along
beaches and rivers where single-family
dwellings are usually not permitted.

Because park trailers can be moved
rapidly, they are allowed in flood zones
where no other structure would be per-
mitted.

Because park trailers are limited to rec-
reational and seasonal use, they should
have no impact on schools. Recreational
parks are permitted to be built where
dwelling construction may face moratori-
ums when the schools reach maximum
capacity.

Because of their temporary use, recre-
ation parks for park trailers are required
to provide half the sanitary sewer facili-
ties required for a manufactured dwelling
parks.

Manufactured dwelling installers are
required to be trained, tested, and
licensed; park trailer installers have no
licensing requirements. m

17



Compliance Report

The Building Codes Division is responsible for the enforcement of Manufactured Dwellings and Structures,
Plumbing, Structural/Mechanical, Electrical and Boiler/Pressure Vessel Specialty Codes to protect the health and
safety of the people of Oregon.

The Electrical and Elevator Board found the following violations of the Oregon
Electrical Safety Law in January 2000:

CITY o NAME ...oooiiiiiiiie e VIOLATION .....ccvieiiiieiiinns CIVIL PENALTY
ASSESSED
Albany ... Birchfield Heating & Air.........cccooovveeiiiiienennns No electrical permit...........coccevviiiieniienennne $250
Conditioning Inc.
Albany .......ccccooeveiiiiee e, Paositive Electric INC. .......ccccvveeviciieeesiiieenn, No electrical permit..........ccoceveeviieveeiiinnennnns $250
Albany ......ccoocviieiii e Robert Wilson .........cccceviieee e, No electrical contractor’s
Robert Wilson Construction license/no electrical
supervising or journeyman’s
license/no electrical permit..........ccccoeevvveeenns $1,250
Bend......cocoiiiiiiiie Security West Locksmith &...........cccceeiiiinnenns No electrical permit.........cceeeeeiiiiinnniinennas $250
Security Service Inc.
Creswell .....oovveveiieee e Don Taylor......cevevvveeeeceee e No electrical permit.........cccoeccvveeviiieeeiiinnen, $250
Grants Pass ........cc.cooueee. Everett Grant aka Skip Grant.............cccceeeenns No electrical supervising
Grant Construction or journeyman’s liCeNSe .......ccccevevvveeeviivvnneennns $500
Gresham ..., Bruce L. Fisk dba ......cccceeeviiiiiiiiiiiee, No electrical contractor’s
Bruce’s Appliance Service license/no electrical
supervising or journeyman’s
license/no electrical permit............ccocovveeeennns $1,250
Gresham ......ccocceveeviiiieec e Matt Hovett .........ccceveeiniiee e, No electrical supervising
or journeyman’s liCeNSe .......ccccevvvveeevivvnnnenn, $ 500
Hermiston .......ccccevevvccieee e, Brian Badgwell .........ccccveevvviveeeniinnnen, No electrical contractor’s

license (2 violations)/no
electrical supervising or
journeyman’s license/no

electrical permit (2 violations)..........ccccccccvveeenn. $,2000
HillSboro .......cceeeeiiiiiie Campbell & Bruce InC. .......cccceeviiiieiiiiiiieen. No electrical permit.........ccoceiiiieriiinennns $250
[ 1155 oTo] o IS Rural Electric INC. .....ccovcvvveeiiiiiieeecieeeeees No electrical permit..........ccocevevvciveeiiinneennns $250
Klamath Falls .........c.ccccceveens Winema Electric INC.......ccoovevviveeiiciee e, No electrical permit.........c.cccveevvceeeeviinnenn $250
LOrane .....cceeiviieiieiiiiee e Dennis R. Hyde ........ccccoviiiiiiiiiiee, No electrical permit
(2 violatioNS) ......ccvevveeiieiie e $500
McMinnville ........cccveevviieeciee, JOSE PErez ...vvvveeeeee e No electrical permit.........ccccccevvveevieeeeinnn, $250
Medford ..........ccccvvenneee. Walt Stallcup Enterprises Inc. dba...........cc....... Permitting an unlicensed
Wendy'’s of Southern Oregon individual to make an
electrical installation/no
electrical permit ........ccccoooeeiiii e $750

18



Portland.............

Portland.............

Portland.............

Portland.............

Roseburg ..........

Roseburg ..........

Roseburg ..........

Tualatin .............

White City..........

Payette, ID

Soledad Electric &
Ampere Electric

................................. NAME .......cccccvvvvvvvvvvvevvveevvevivevvnenvsnnsnnnnnnns. VIOLATION ... CIVIL PENALTY
ASSESSED
............................. Jeff Cohen ............cccceeeevvvveeeeenee.... NO electrical supervising
or journeyman’s liCense .........cccceevevvvveeeeninnnen. $500
............... Hallmark Construction Corp. .......................... No electrical contractor’s
license/no electrical permit
(5 violations) ......ccovevveeiieiie e $1,750
.......................... Don Byrne dba ..............cccceeeeeneeee....e.. NO €electrical supervising
Byrne’'s Home Repair Inc. or journeyman'’s license/
no electrical permit.........ccoceeveieeiiieciineen, $750
................... Northwest Comfort Inc................................ NO electrical contractor’s

license (2 violations)/no
electrical permit

(2 violations) ........ccocveeviieeiiie e, $1,500
...................... Sound Security INC. ......ccccveveveeriiienvenenenn... NO €lectrical permit......cooceeeceeeevcieeiieenne.. $250
dba Sonitrol Pacific
.............................. Ed Wilson ........cccccevveeviieeviieesneeenee.. Allowed unlicensed

individual to make
electrical installation/

no electrical permit.........ccccceevvieiicieciieee, $750
......................... Danny Johnson...............c...eevvveennnneee... NO €lectrical supervising
or journeyman'’s license/
no electrical permit.........ccccceevveeiiiieeiieeen, $750
...................... J. Wikstrom Inc. dba..............c.ccceeeeeeeneeeee. NO electrical permit
Overhead Door Company of Roseburg (6 violations) ......cccoviiieeiiiiiiee e $1500
................... Kunert Electric LLC dba. ................cccvvveeenneeee... NO electrical permit..........ccoceeeevceeeevniee..... $250
Kunert Electric
............................ Daniel Remy ............cccceeevevvveeennn.... NO €lectrical supervising
Southern Oregon Alarms or journeyman'’s license/
no electrical permit.........cccoceevvveiicieeiieee, $750
.................. Connections Electric Inc. ..............ccccecennee..... Allowed unlicensed
individual to make
electrical installation .............cccceevveiveeeieennen. $500
............. Steven E. Hauck aka Ed Hauck........................... Signing supervisor for
two electrical contractors
(2 violations) .......ccvvveeeiiie e $500
..................... Jahnke Heating & Air ..........c...ceeeevveevneee.... NO €lectrical permit.......cccoccoeeeevvceee ... $250
Conditioning Inc.
......................... David M. Phipps .......ccccccevvvieeeivcieeeennnenee.. Allowed unlicensed
Fire Protection Services individual to make
electrical installation .............cccceevveiieecieennen, $500
............................ Brad Gordon ............ccccceeecvveeeeneeee..... NO €lectrical supervising
or journeyman’s liCenSe .........cccevvevvvveeeeeinnnen. $500
.......................... Dana F. Hadley.........c.....ccceeeeevvvvereennnenne.. NO electrical permit......cccceeeveveeviieeeevne.. $250
Hadley Electric
......................... Timothy Schmidt................c...ccveeeneee.... NO €lectrical supervising .......occceeveveiiirenene.... $500

or journeyman’s license



CITY e NAME ..o VIOLATION ....coeeviiiiieen CIVIL PENALTY

ASSESSED
Weiser, ID ..., Gregory C. SYME ...ccveeveiiiieee e Allowed unlicensed
Syme Electric individual to make

electrical installation .............cccceevveiiieecveennen, $500

Hampstead, MD .........cccoceeiiiienennns Jeff RUFO ..., No electrical supervising
or journeyman’s liCEeNSe .........ccccevevviieeeenninnnn. $500

Kalispell, MT .....cccovveiiiiireei Alamon Telco INC. ....ccvvveviviiee e, No electrical contractor’s
license/no electrical permit..........cccocevevvcieeeenns $750

Kalispell, MT ..., Paul Shaver .........ccccooviiiiiie No electrical supervising
or journeyman’s liCEeNSe .........ccoocevevriieeeennnnnn. $500

Kalispell, MT ..., Dan Ware ........ccccceeeiiiieeeniiieee e No electrical supervising
or journeyman’s liCEeNSe .........ccoocevevviieeeenninnen. $500

Kalispell, MT ..o Robert Williams ........cccccccvevevviieeene No electrical supervising
or journeyman’s liCeNSe .........cccevvevvvveeeeninnnen. $500

Nashville, TN .......ccoceeiiiiinnenns Nortel Networks INC. .......cceevviiieieiiiiienenns No electrical contractor’s
license/no electrical permit...........cccceevvieinne $750

Brush Prairie, WA ........cccccvninnnn. Garrett Halls ........ccoeeeiiiiiiiiiis No electrical supervising
or journeyman’s liCEeNSe .........cccoevevriieeeenninnen. $500

Kennewick, WA ...........cccee... Rodney W. Kneebone .........cccccevvveeeenee, No electrical supervising
or journeyman’s liCenSe .........ccceevvevvvveeeeninnnen. $500

The Director of the Department of Consumer and Business Services found the
following violations of the Oregon Specialty Codes in January 2000:

Albany ... Birchfield Heating & Air.........cccocceveiiiinnnannns No mechanical permit............cccoceeiriineeennnnn $250
Conditioning Inc.

Gresham ..o Bruce L. FisK......ooooiiiiiiiiiiiiieee No mechanical permit...........cccccoeveeiiniinneens $250
Bruce’s Appliance Service

Portland........cccceeevee e, DON BYIME ...eviveeeceee e No plumbing permit .........ccocceevicereiicieeenns $250
Byrne’'s Home Repair Inc.

Roseburg .......cccooviiiiiis A CPlumbing INC. ....ccooviiiiiiiiiiiiieeee No plumbing permit ..........ccoccoeeiiiiiiieininen. $250

Roseburg ......ccccooiiiiis Gary R. Yaeger Jr. ....ccooveeiiniiiiiieeiieee e No plumbing permit .........cccoccoieeiiiiieeininen. $250

Gary Yaeger’'s Plumbing

The Director of the Department of Consumer and Business Services found the
following violations of amusement rides and regulation of manufactured dwellings
in February 2000:

Portland ..o, Randolph R. ROSS ......coociiiiiiiiiieiiiieeeee No amusement ride
Randy’s Funland operating permit
(18 violations) ........cccvevveeviiecieece e $9,000
Salem ..., Kevin Fredinburg ........c.cccociiiiii Failed to return

certification tags to
division upon expiration
Of ICENSE ..ot $250

20



Interpretive rulings signed

The State Plumbing Board and the divi-
sion administrator have approved two inter-
pretive rulings for statewide application.
Copies were mailed to all building officials and
posted on the division’s Web site.

99-5 approves use of the EVAC vacuum
condensate collection system for supermarket
freezer and cooler display cases as an alter-
nate system to that prescribed in Chapter 8 of
the Oregon Plumbing Specialty Code.
Chapter 8 addresses indirect and special
wastes. This ruling permits these installations
in Oregon supermarkets when installed in ac-
cordance with the April 1999 EVAC Vacuum
Collection System Design Manual for Super-
markets, the applicable provisions of the
Oregon State Plumbing Specialty Code, and
the following:

The installation shall be designed by an
Oregon-registered engineer

e The installation shall be made by an
Oregon-licensed plumber

« The installation shall be inspected by the
plumbing inspector of the jurisdiction
having authority

* The installation shall not include sani-
tary-drainage wastes

99-6 approves site-specific use of the Bio-
logical Mediation Systems, Inc., DEVAP™
2000 or “Outback” vault evaporator waste dis-
posal system at Smith Rock State Park. This
system is an alternative to systems pre-
scribed in Oregon State Plumbing Specialty
Code Chapter 7, and is approved for this site
only and not for statewide use. m

Interpretive rulings rescinded

The Building Codes Structures Board and
BCD administrator recently approved rescis-
sion of the following interpretations because
current code provisions adequately address
the issues originally raised:

92-2, Chapter 53 Requirements for Existing
Buildings

92-16, Insulation for Exterior Basement Walls

93-10, Energy Requirements for Solariums ®

Notice

In December, the State Plumbing Board approved deletion of Section
815.0, Air-Conditioning Equipment, and addition of ANSI A118.10-93 to Table
14-1, in the 2000 Oregon Plumbing Specialty Code effective April 1, 2000. m

21



New elevation certificate phase-in period extended

22

The Federal Emergency Management
Agency (FEMA) issued a new elevation certifi-
cate in August 1999. Elevation certificates are
critical for administration of the National Flood
Insurance Program. The certificates are used to
ensure that new development meets local flood-
plain development standards, to establish insur-
ance rates, and to request flood map
amendments and revisions. FEMA originally re-
quired the new elevation form to be used for
certificates on or after January 1, 2000. How-
ever, since the release of the new form in Au-
gust, local governments, insurance agents,
engineers, and surveyors have expressed con-
cerns about implementing the new certificate.
FEMA has extended the phase-in
period for use of the new elevation certifi-
cate to October 1, 2000. Local jurisdictions
should be using the new certificate now, accord-
ing to a statement by George Currin, FEMA Re-
gion 10, at the February 4 OBOA quarterly
business meeting. This extension allows time

for additional training for insurance agents and
others on how to complete and use the new
certificate.

Local governments may accept the old el-
evation certificate until October 1, but are en-
couraged to begin using the new certificates.
The new certificates require surveyors and en-
gineers to provide additional building eleva-
tions. These additional elevations provide
insurance agents with information needed to
accurately evaluate flood risk.

The new elevation certificates are available
on FEMA's Web site at www.fema.gov/nfip .
The certificates can be downloaded as
Microsoft word documents or in pdf form. Cop-
ies of form 81-31 can also be ordered
by calling FEMA's distribution center, (800) 480-
2520.

Questions about the new form should be di-
rected to Ann Beier, Oregon National Flood In-
surance Program coordinator, (503) 373-0050,
ext. 255. m

Dangerous products recalled, continued

to the firm for a full refund plus postage. For de-
tails, call New Buffalo Corp., (800) 568-6657.

Furnaces recalled. York International is
recalling 21,000 York Diamond 80 downflow
mid-efficieny furnaces with model numbers
starting with P2DP, PBKD, or XEDO2.

Because of inadequate gluing, the insula-
tion around the heat exchanger can separate
and fall onto the heat exchanger. This could
cause surrounding material and drywall
to ignite.

York began this recall in late 1997; how-
ever, only about 9,000 of the furnaces have
been repaired as of November 1999. Con-
sumers should contact their local York dealer
for a free repair visit. For details, call York
International/UPG Technical Services,

(877) 874-7478 or visit www.york.com/
upgsafe/safety.htm.

Electrical testers recalled. Fluke Corp.
is recalling 58,000 T-2 hand-held electrical
voltage/continuity testers. The batteries can
lose contact due to corrosion in the battery
compartment, causing the device to lose
power. Consumers testing electrical sources
may not be warned of live current if the
tester is not powered, posing a risk of shock
and burns.

The tester body is yellow and black, and
measures 6.25 inches long by 1.75 inches
wide and 1.25 inches thick. The wire leads
are black with one black and one red probe.
Recalled units have serial numbers lower
than 74165430.

For details, call Fluke, (800) 753-8646 or
check its Web site, www.fluke.com.

From the Gated Wye



Board meeting dates

Electrical & Elevator Board State Plumbing Board

Meets at 9:30 a.m. on the fourth Thursday of Meets at 9:00 a.m. on the third Friday of
each month: every other month:

m  March 24 m April 21

m April 23

o Board of Boiler Rules
BUIldlng Codes Structures Board  Meets at 9:30 a.m. on the first Tuesday of

Meets at 9:00 a.m. on the first Wednesday of ~ each quarter:

each month: m March7

m Marchl . -

. Asﬂf5 Tri-County Building Industry
Service Board

Manufactured Structures Meets at 9:30 a.m. on the second Wednes-

& Parks Advisory Board day of each month:

Meets at 9:30 a.m. on the second Thursday of = March 8 (City of West Linn)

each quarter: m  April 12 (City of West Linn)

m April 13

MEETINGS ARE HELD IN THE SALEM BCD
CONFERENCE ROOM AT
1535 EDGEWATER ST. NW
EXCEPT THE TRI-COUNTY BOARD

oD E = Subscription and adaress
< corrections

0 Address correction — Send to: Nz

BUILDING CODES DIVISION
PO BOX 14470 Title/Company:

SALEM, OR 97309-0404

0 New subscription — Enclosed is my Address:

check payable to DCBS for $25 for  City/State/zIP:

the calendar year 2000 (Jan.-Dec.)
Phone: ( )

subscription.

Send to: DEPARTMENT USE ONLY 1087/70050
DEPARTMENT OF CONSUMER

& BUSINESS SERVICES
FISCAL SECTION

350 WINTER ST. NE
SALEM, OR 97301-3878




Staff advisories, continued

3144 in the 1999 Oregon legislative session. This bill became ef-
fective October 23, 1999. The bill requires that the engineering
services for significant structures be provided by engineers regis-
tered and licensed by the Oregon Board of Engineers to practice
structural engineering. The option to be licensed as a structural
engineer is available with the Oregon Board of Engineers for
those who meet the criteria and who want to test for structural
engineering with the board. Engineers who are not licensed to
practice structural engineering but are otherwise practicing struc-
tural engineering, would need to be licensed by the Oregon
Board of Engineers under HB 3144.

According to the secretary of the Oregon Board of Engineers,
the lateral-load-resisting frame system of significant structures,
submitted after October 23, 1999, for plan review must be de-
signed by either a registered structural engineer or by a civil en-
gineer who is practicing structural engineering and who has
submitted an application to the Oregon Board of Engineers for
registration as a structural engineer by the October 23, 1999 cut-
off date. Building officials may need to call Oregon Board of En-
gineers to verify whether the structural designer of a significant
structure meets the registration requirements of HB 3144.

Based on a conversation with an SEAO member and the
State of Oregon Legislative Counsel, HB 3144 does not affect
the existing architect's law. The exemptions applicable to
architects under their statutes are unaffected by the HB 3144
provisions. ®

440-2666 (3/00/COM)

N

STATE OF OREGON « BUILDING CODES DIVISION

Codelink is the bimonthly publication of the
Oregon Department of Consumer & Business
Services Building Codes Division.

Editor
Louann Rahmig

Design & Layout
DCBS Communications

BCD Administrator
Joseph A. Brewer 1|

In compliance with the Americans with
Disabilities Act (ADA), this publication
is available in alternative formats.
Call the editor, (503) 373-7438.

Information in CodeLink may be
republished without permission.

Visit our Internet Web site at
http://www.cbs.state.or.us/bcd

Building Codes Division
1535 Edgewater St. NW
PO Box 14470

Salem, OR 97309-0404

Address Correction Requested

Bulk Rate
U.S. Postage
PAID
Salem, OR
Permit No. 24




	Dangerous products recalled 
	News from the administrators 
	Administrative rules filed 
	Staff advisories issued 
	CABO One and Two Family Dwelling  Code and International One- and  Two-Family Dwelling Code lists  significant changes, 1995-19
	Prison construction code change 
	Manufactured structures  and parks Q & A 
	Compliance Report 
	Interpretive rulings signed 
	Interpretive rulings rescinded 
	Notice 
	New elevation certificate  phase-in period extended 
	Board meeting dates 
	Subscription and address corrections 

