
Revised 4/5/10 

1 

 

 

CHAPTER 1 
 

ADMINISTRATION 

 

SECTION 101 

 

GENERAL 

 

101.1 Title. These regulations shall be known as the Oregon  

Solar Installation Specialty Code, hereinafter referred to as “this code.” 

 

101.2 Scope. 

 

[OR]  101.2.1 General.  

1. The provisions of this code shall apply to all aspects of the structural requirements for 

the installation, alteration, replacement and repair of solar Photovoltaic (PV) systems. 

 

Exceptions: 

1.1 This code shall not apply to the installation, alteration, re- 

placement, repair of PV systems in a public way. 

1.2 This code shall not apply to the installation of structural components on exempt 

agricultural buildings as defined in ORS 455.315. 

 

2. Electrical installation, alteration and repair as defined in ORS 479.510-895 are 

controlled by OESC chapter 690, replicated in Appendix A. 

 

3. Existing PV installations. Existing PV installations that complied with minimum safety 

standards in effect at time of installation shall not be considered in violation of the 

current minimum PV installation standards unless the use or occupancy changed, 

requiring different methods, alterations or additions or the International Fire Code or 

Building Official requires updates to protect the safety of the occupants and public. 

 

455.020 Purpose; scope of application; exceptions; scope of 

rules; fees by rule. (1) This chapter is enacted to enable the 

Director of the Department of Consumer and Business 

Services to promulgate a state building code to govern the 

construction, reconstruction, alteration and repair of buildings 

and other structures and the installation of mechanical devices 

and equipment therein, and to require the correction of unsafe 

conditions caused by earthquakes in existing buildings. The 

state building code shall establish uniform performance 

standards providing reasonable safeguards for health, safety, 

welfare, comfort and security of the residents of this state who 

are occupants and users of buildings, and will provide for the 

use of modern methods, devices, materials, techniques and 



Revised 4/5/10 

2 

 

practicable maximum energy conservation. 

 (2) The rules adopted pursuant to this chapter shall include 

structural standards; standards for the installation and use of 

mechanical, heating and ventilating devices and equipment; 

and standards for prefabricated structures; and shall, subject to 

ORS 455.210, prescribe reasonable fees for the issuance of 

building permits and similar documents, inspections and plan 

review services by the Department of Consumer and Business 

Services. The department may also establish, by rule, the 

amount of any fee pertaining to the state building code or any 

specialty code that is authorized by statute, but for which an 

amount is not specified by statute. 

 (3) This chapter does not affect the statutory jurisdiction 

and authority of the Workers’ Compensation Board, under 

ORS chapter 654, to promulgate occupational safety and health 

standards relating to places of employment, and to administer 

and enforce all state laws, regulations, rules, standards and 

lawful orders requiring places of employment to be safe and 

healthful. 

 (4) This chapter and any specialty code does not limit 

the authority of a municipality to enact regulations providing 

for local administration of the state building code; local appeal 

boards; fees and other charges; abatement of nuisances and 

dangerous buildings; enforcement through penalties, stop-work 

orders or other means; or minimum health, sanitation and 

safety standards for governing the use of structures for 

housing, except where the power of municipalities to enact any 

such regulations is expressly withheld or otherwise provided 

for by statute. Pursuant to the regulation of dangerous 

buildings, a municipality may adopt seismic rehabilitation 

plans that provide for phased completion of repairs that are 

designed to provide improved life safety but that may be less 

than the standards for new buildings. 

 

101.3 Intent. The purpose of this code is to establish the minimum requirements for the 

installation of PV components and support systems to safeguard the public health, safety and 

general welfare through structural strength and safety to life and property from fire and other 

hazards associated with the installation of PV systems, and to provide safety to fire fighters and 

emergency responders during emergency operations. 

 

It is not the purpose of this code to create or otherwise establish or designate any particular 

class or group of persons who will or should be especially protected or benefited by the terms 

of this code. It does not affect the requirements contained in ORS 479.620-479.630 or the rules 

thereunder. 



Revised 4/5/10 

3 

 

101.4 Statutory References. This code is adopted pursuant to the Oregon Revised Statutes. 

Where in any specific case this code and the statutes specify different requirements, the statute 

shall govern. Statutes related to this code are ORS 455.010 through 455.895. 

 

101.5 Severability. In the event that any part or provision of this code is held to be illegal or 

void, this shall not have the effect of making void or illegal any of the other parts or provisions. 

 

 

SECTION 102 
 

APPLICABILITY 

 

102.1 General. Where there is a conflict between a general requirement and a specific 

requirement, the specific requirement shall be applicable. Where, in any specific case, different 

sections of this code specify different materials, methods of construction or other requirements, 

the most restrictive shall govern. 

 

102.2 Other laws. The provisions of this code shall not be deemed to nullify any provisions of 

local, state or federal law. 

 

102.3 Application of references. References to chapter or section numbers, or to provisions 

not specifically identified by number, shall be construed to refer to such chapter, section or 

provision of this code. 

 

102.4 Referenced codes and standards. The codes and standards referenced in this code shall 

be considered part of the requirements of this code to the prescribed extent of each such 

reference. Where differences occur between provisions of this code and referenced codes and 

standards, the provisions of this code shall apply. 

 

101.4.1 Electrical.  Where not specifically addressed in this code, the provisions of the Oregon 

Electrical Specialty Code (OESC), based on the NFPA 70- National Electrical Code, shall 

apply to the installation and connection of electrical systems. 

 

102.4.2 Structural.  Where not specifically addressed in this code, the provisions of the 

Oregon Structural Specialty Code (OSSC), shall apply to the design and installation of 

structural support systems for PV installations. 

 

Exception: The structural requirements for PV installations 

for detached one-and-two-family dwellings and multiple  

single-family dwellings (townhouses) not more than three 

stories above grade plan in height with a separate means of 

egress and their accessory structures shall comply with the  

applicable prescriptive requirements of the Oregon  

Residential Specialty Code. 

 

 



Revised 4/5/10 

4 

 

SECTION 103 
 

DUTIES AND POWERS OF THE BUILDING OFFICIAL 

 

103.1 General. The building official is hereby authorized and directed to enforce the 

provisions of this code under ORS 455.148 or 455.150. The building official shall have the 

authority to render interpretations of this code and to adopt policies and procedures in order to 

clarify the application of its provisions. Such interpretations, policies and procedures shall be in 

compliance with the intent and purpose of this code. Such policies and procedures shall not 

have the effect of waiving requirements specifically provided for in this code. 

 

103.2 Applications and permits. The building official shall receive applications, review 

construction documents and issue permits for the installation, alteration, replacement, repair of 

PV systems including the electrical and structural requirements inspect the premises for which 

such permits have been issued and enforce compliance with the provisions of this code. 

 

Separate electrical permits are required under the Oregon Electrical Specialty Code and 

administrative rule 908-309. 

 

103.3 Notices and orders. The building official shall issue all necessary notices or orders to 

ensure compliance with this code. 

 

103.4 Inspections. The building official shall make all of the required inspections, or the 

building official shall have the authority to accept reports of inspection by approved agencies or 

individuals. Reports of such inspections shall be in writing and be certified by a responsible 

officer of such approved agency or by the responsible individual. 

 

103.5 Reserved. 

 

103.6 Right of entry. Where it is necessary to make an inspection to enforce the provisions of 

this code, or where the building official has reasonable cause to believe that there exists in a 

structure or upon a premises a condition which is contrary to or in violation of this code which 

makes the structure or premises unsafe, dangerous or hazardous, the building official is 

authorized to enter the structure or premises at reasonable times to inspect or to perform the 

duties imposed by this code, provided that if such structure or premises be occupied that 

credentials be presented to the occupant and entry requested. If such structure or premises is 

unoccupied, the building official shall first make a reasonable effort to locate the owner or 

other person having charge or control of the structure or premises and request entry. If entry is 

refused, the building official shall have recourse to the remedies provided by law to secure 

entry. 

 

103.7 Department records. The building official shall keep official records as dictated by 

OAR 166-150-0020 where a county has jurisdiction; OAR 166-200-0025 where a city has 

jurisdiction; and OAR Chapter 166 Division 300 et al for the cities and counties where the State 

of Oregon has jurisdiction.  Such records shall be retained in the official records for the period 

indicated in the respective OARs noted above.  The building official shall maintain a 



Revised 4/5/10 

5 

 

permanent record of all permits issued in flood hazard areas, including copies of inspection 

reports and certifications required in Section 1612. 

 

103.8 Liability. See ORS 30.265 for regulations relating to liability. 

 

30.265 Scope of liability of public body, officers, employees 

and agents; liability in nuclear incident. (1) Subject to the 

limitations of ORS 30.260 to 30.300, every public body is 

subject to action or suit for its torts and those of its officers, 

employees and agents acting within the scope of their 

employment or duties, whether arising out of a governmental 

or proprietary function or while operating a motor vehicle in a 

ridesharing arrangement authorized under ORS 276.598. The 

sole cause of action for any tort of officers, employees or 

agents of a public body acting within the scope of their 

employment or duties and eligible for representation and 

indemnification under ORS 30.285 or 30.287 shall be an 

action against the public body only. The remedy provided by 

ORS 30.260 to 30.300 is exclusive of any other action or suit 

against any such officer, employee or agent of a public body 

whose act or omission within the scope of the officer’s, 

employee’s or agent’s employment or duties gives rise to the 

action or suit. No other form of civil action or suit shall be 

permitted. If an action or suit is filed against an officer, 

employee or agent of a public body, on appropriate motion the 

public body shall be substituted as the only defendant. 

Substitution of the public body as the defendant does not 

exempt the public body from making any report required under 

ORS 742.400. 

(2) Every public body is immune from liability for any claim 

for injury to or death of any person or injury to property 

resulting from an act or omission of an officer, employee or 

agent of a public body when such officer, employee or agent is 

immune from liability. 

(3) Every public body and its officers, employees and agents 

acting within the scope of their employment or duties, or while 

operating a motor vehicle in a ridesharing arrangement 

authorized under ORS 276.598, are immune from liability for: 

(a) Any claim for injury to or death of any person covered by 

any workers’ compensation law. 

(b) Any claim in connection with the assessment and 

collection of taxes. 

(c) Any claim based upon the performance of or the failure to 

exercise or perform a discretionary function or duty, whether 



Revised 4/5/10 

6 

 

or not the discretion is abused. 

(d) Any claim that is limited or barred by the provisions of any 

other statute, including but not limited to any statute of 

ultimate repose. 

(e) Any claim arising out of riot, civil commotion or mob 

action or out of any act or omission in connection with the 

prevention of any of the foregoing. 

(f) Any claim arising out of an act done or omitted under 

apparent authority of a law, resolution, rule or regulation that 

is unconstitutional, invalid or inapplicable except to the extent 

that they would have been liable had the law, resolution, rule 

or regulation been constitutional, valid and applicable, unless 

such act was done or omitted in bad faith or with malice. 

(4) Subsection (1) of this section applies to any action of any 

officer, employee or agent of the state relating to a nuclear 

incident, whether or not the officer, employee or agent is 

acting within the scope of employment, and provided the 

nuclear incident is covered by an insurance or indemnity 

agreement under 42 U.S.C. 2210. 

(5) Subsection (3)(c) of this section does not apply to any 

discretionary act that is found to be the cause or partial cause 

of a nuclear incident covered by an insurance or indemnity 

agreement under the provisions of 42 U.S.C. 2210, including 

but not limited to road design and route selection. 

 

 

103.9 Approved materials and equipment. Materials, equipment and devices approved by the 

building official shall be constructed and installed in accordance with such approval. 

 

103.9.1 Used materials and equipment. The use of used materials which meet the 

requirements of this code for new materials is permitted. 

 

103.10 Modifications. Wherever there are practical difficulties involved in carrying out the 

provisions of this code, the building official shall have the authority to grant modifications for 

individual cases, upon application of the owner or owner’s representative, provided the 

building official shall first find that special individual reason makes the strict letter of this code 

impractical and the modification is in compliance with the intent and purpose of this code and 

that such modification does not lessen health, accessibility, life and fire safety, or structural 

requirements. The details of action granting modifications shall be recorded and entered in the 

files of the department of building safety. 

 

103.11 Alternative materials, design and methods of construction and equipment. The 

provisions of this code are not intended to prevent the installation of any material or to prohibit 

any design or method of construction not specifically prescribed by this code, provided that any 



Revised 4/5/10 

7 

 

such alternative has been approved. An alternative material, design or method of construction 

shall be approved where the building official finds that the proposed design is satisfactory and 

complies with the intent of the provisions of this code, and that the material, method or work 

offered is, for the purpose intended, at least the equivalent of that prescribed in this code in 

quality, strength, effectiveness, fire resistance, durability and safety. 

 

103.11.1 Tests. Whenever there is insufficient evidence of compliance with the 

provisions of this code, or evidence that a material or method does not conform to the 

requirements of this code, or in order to substantiate claims for alternative materials or 

methods, the building official shall have the authority to require tests as evidence of 

compliance to be made at no expense to the jurisdiction. Test methods shall be as 

specified in this code or by other recognized test standards. In the absence of recognized 

and accepted test methods, the building official shall approve the testing procedures. 

Tests shall be performed by an approved agency. Reports of such tests shall be retained 

by the building official for the period required for retention of public records. 

 

 

SECTION 104 
 

PERMITS 

 

104.1 Required. Any owner or authorized agent who intends to construct, enlarge, alter, repair, 

move, demolish, or change the installation of a PV system or the installation of which is 

regulated by this code, or to cause any such work to be done, shall first make application to the 

building official and obtain the required permit. 

 

104.2 Work exempt from permit. Exemptions from permit requirements of this code shall not 

be deemed to grant authorization for any work to be done in any manner in violation of the 

provisions of this code or any other laws or ordinances of this jurisdiction. Permits shall not be 

required for the following: 

 

Temporary testing systems: A permit shall not be required for the installation of any temporary 

system. 

 

104.2.1 Emergency repairs. Where equipment replacements and repairs must be 

performed in an emergency situation, the permit application shall be submitted within 

the next working business day to the building official. 

 

104.2.2 Public service agencies. A permit shall not be required for the installation, 

alteration or repair of generation, transmission, distribution or metering or other related 

equipment that is under the ownership and control of public service agencies by 

established right. 

 

104.3 Application for permit. To obtain a permit, the applicant shall first file an application 

therefor in writing on a form furnished by the building department for that purpose. 

Such application shall: 



Revised 4/5/10 

8 

 

1. Identify and describe the work to be covered by the permit for which application is made. 

2. Describe the land on which the proposed work is to be done by legal description, street 

address or similar description that will readily identify and definitely locate the proposed 

building or work. 

3. Be accompanied by construction documents and other information as required in Section 

105. 

4. State the valuation of the proposed work. 

5. Be signed by the applicant, or the applicant’s authorized agent. 

6. Give such other data and information as required by the building official. 

 

104.3.1 Action on application. The building official shall examine or cause to be 

examined applications for permits and amendments thereto within a reasonable time 

after filing. If the application or the construction documents do not conform to the 

requirements of pertinent laws, the building official shall reject such application in 

writing, stating the reasons therefor. If the building official is satisfied that the proposed 

work conforms to the requirements of this code and laws and ordinances applicable 

thereto, the building official shall issue a permit therefor as soon as practicable. 

 

104.3.2 Time limitation of application. An application for a permit for any proposed 

work shall be deemed to have been abandoned 180 days after the date of filing, unless 

such application has been pursued in good faith or a permit has been issued; except that 

the building official is authorized to grant one or more extensions of time for additional 

periods not exceeding 90 days each. The extension shall be requested in writing and 

justifiable cause demonstrated. 

 

104.4 Validity of permit. The issuance or granting of a permit shall not be construed to be a 

permit for, or an approval of, any violation of any of the provisions of this code or of any other 

ordinance of the jurisdiction. Permits presuming to give authority to violate or cancel the 

provisions of this code or other ordinances of the jurisdiction shall not be valid. The issuance of 

a permit based on construction documents and other data shall not prevent the building official 

from requiring the correction of errors in the construction documents and other data. The 

building official is also authorized to prevent occupancy or use of a structure where in violation 

of this code or of any other ordinances of the jurisdiction. 

 

104.5 Expiration. Every permit issued shall become invalid unless the work on the site 

authorized by such permit is commenced within 180 days after its issuance, or if the work 

authorized on the site by such permit is suspended or abandoned for a period of 180 days after 

the time the work is commenced. The building official is authorized to grant, in writing, one or 

more extensions of time, for periods not more than 180 days each. The extension shall be 

requested in writing and justifiable cause demonstrated. 

 

104.6 Suspension or revocation. The building official is authorized to suspend or revoke a 

permit issued under the provisions of this code wherever the permit is issued in error or on the 

basis of incorrect, inaccurate or incomplete information, or in violation of any ordinance or 

regulation or any of the provisions of this code. 

 



Revised 4/5/10 

9 

 

104.7 Placement of permit. The building permit or copy shall be kept on the site of the work 

until the completion of the project. 

 

 

SECTION 105 
 

SUBMITTAL DOCUMENTS 

 

 

105.1 General. Submittal documents consisting of construction documents, statement of 

special inspections, geotechnical report and other data shall be submitted in two or more sets 

with each permit application. The construction documents shall be prepared by a registered 

design professional where required by the building codes. Where special conditions exist, the 

building official is authorized to require additional construction documents to be prepared by a 

registered design professional. 

 

Exceptions: 

1. The building official is authorized to waive the submission of construction 

documents and other data not required to be prepared by a registered design 

professional if it is found that the nature of the work applied for is such that review 

of construction documents is not necessary to obtain compliance with this code. 

2. Plans, calculations and specifications, diagrams and other data prepared and 

designed by an architect or an engineer licensed by the state to practice as such are 

not required for the following work, provided the building official determines that 

the work is not of a highly technical nature or there is unreasonable potential risk to 

life and/or the safety of the structure: 

2.1 The erection, enlargement or alteration of any building, or any appurtenance 

thereto, where the resulting building has a ground area of 4,000 square feet 

(372m
2
) or less and is not more than 20 feet (6096 mm) in height from the top 

surface of the lowest floor to the highest interior finish (See ORS 671.030). 

2.2 A single family dwelling, a farm agricultural building, non-farm agricultural 

building, or accessory building to a single-family dwelling. 

2.3 Alterations or repairs that do not involve structural parts of the building. 

3. Where applicant has demonstrated on a form approved by the division that they 

have met the requirements of 304.9 [Fire Fighter Access] and 305.4 [Prescriptive 

Path]. 

 

105.2 Construction documents. Construction documents shall be in accordance with Sections 

105.2.1 through 105.2.5. 

 

Exception: Construction documents, other than as provided for in 105.1(B) shall not be 

required when the installation complies with section 304.9 and 305.4. 

 

105.2.1. Construction Documents: The following construction documents shall be 

provided to the Authority Having Jurisdiction at the time of permit application. 

 



Revised 4/5/10 

10 

 

105.2.2 Support Structure: The construction documents shall describe, with sufficient 

clarity, the structure required to support the components and to resist the applicable 

snow, seismic, wind and uplift forces as defined in the Oregon Structural Specialty 

Code (OSSC).  The construction documents, including calculations, shall be prepared 

by an Architect or Engineer licensed to practice in the state of Oregon and shall be 

designed in accordance with the requirements of the OSSC. 

 

105.2.3 Component Attachment: The construction documents shall be in sufficient 

clarity to show attachments are designed to resist the applicable snow, seismic, wind 

and uplift forces on the solar components as defined in the OSSC.  The construction 

documents, including calculations, shall be prepared by an Architect or Engineer 

licensed to practice in the state of Oregon and shall be designed in accordance with the 

requirements of the Oregon Structural Specialty Code. 

 

Exception:  Construction documents showing component attachment shall not 

be required to be prepared by an Architect or Engineer licensed in the State of 

Oregon when the manufacturers installation instructions provide designs 

sufficient for the applicable snow, seismic, wind and uplift loads. 

 

105.2.5 Building and Site Plan:  The construction documents shall show and describe, 

with sufficient clarity, the location(s) of the solar components in relation to buildings, 

structures, property lines and, as applicable, flood hazard areas, floodways and shall 

show compliance with local zoning, planning, solar access requirements, etc, if 

applicable, as required by the Building Official. The building official is authorized to 

waive or modify the requirement for a site plan when the application for permit is for 

alteration or repair or when otherwise warranted. 

 

Exception:  Subject to the approval of the Building Official, construction 

documents showing the building and site plan shall not be required when, due to 

the nature of the project, it can be demonstrated that there are no significant 

impacts to the items in listed above. 

 

105.2.5.1 Design flood elevations. Where design flood elevations are not 

specified, they shall be established in accordance with OSSC Section 1612.3.1. 

 

105.2.6 Information on construction documents. Construction documents shall be 

dimensioned and drawn upon suitable material. Electronic media documents are 

permitted to be submitted when approved by the building official. Construction 

documents shall be of sufficient clarity to indicate the location, nature and extent of the 

work proposed and show in detail that it will conform to the provisions of this code and 

relevant laws, ordinances, rules and regulations, as determined by the building official. 

 

105.3 Examination of documents. The building official shall examine or cause to be 

examined the accompanying submittal documents and shall ascertain by such examinations 

whether the construction indicated and described is in accordance with the requirements of this 

code and other pertinent laws or ordinances. 



Revised 4/5/10 

11 

 

105.3.1 Approval of construction documents. When the building official issues a 

permit, the construction documents shall be approved, in writing or by stamp, as 

“Reviewed for Code Compliance.” One set of construction documents so reviewed shall 

be retained by the building official. The other set shall be returned to the applicant, shall 

be kept at the site of work and shall be open to inspection by the building official or a 

duly authorized representative. 

 

105.3.2 Previous approvals. This code shall not require changes in the construction 

documents, construction or designated occupancy of a structure for which a lawful 

permit has been heretofore issued or otherwise lawfully authorized, and the construction 

of which has been pursued in good faith within 180 days after the effective date of this 

code and has not been abandoned. 

 

105.3.3 Phased approval. The building official is authorized to issue a permit for the 

construction of foundations or any other part of a building or structure before the 

construction documents for the whole building or structure have been submitted, 

provided that adequate information and detailed statements have been filed complying 

with pertinent requirements of this code. The holder of such permit for the foundation 

or other parts of a building or structure shall proceed at the holder’s own risk with the 

building operation and without assurance that a permit for the entire structure will be 

granted. 

 

105.3.4 Design professional in responsible charge. 

 

105.3.4.1 General. When it is required that documents be prepared by a 

registered design professional, the building official shall be authorized to require 

the owner to engage and designate on the building permit application a 

registered design professional who shall act as the registered design professional 

in responsible charge.If the circumstances require, the owner shall designate a 

substitute registered design professional in responsible charge who shall perform 

the duties required of the original registered design professional in responsible 

charge. The building official shall be notified in writing by the owner if the 

registered design professional in responsible charge is changed or is unable to 

continue to perform the duties. The registered design professional in responsible 

charge shall be responsible for reviewing and coordinating submittal documents 

prepared by others, including phased and deferred submittal items, for 

compatibility with the design of the structure. 

 

105.3.4.2 Deferred submittals. For the purposes of this section, deferred 

submittals are defined as those portions of the design that are not submitted at 

the time of the application and that are to be submitted to the building official 

within a specified period. 

 

Deferral of any submittal items shall have the prior approval of the building 

official. The registered design professional in responsible charge shall list the 



Revised 4/5/10 

12 

 

deferred submittals on the construction documents for review by the building 

official. 

 

Documents for deferred submittal items shall be submitted to the registered 

design professional in responsible charge who shall review them and forward 

them to the building official with a notation indicating that the deferred 

submittal documents have been reviewed and found to be in general 

conformance to the design of the building. The deferred submittal items shall 

not be installed until the deferred submittal documents have been approved by 

the building official. 

 

105.4 Amended construction documents. Work shall be installed in accordance with the 

approved construction documents, and any changes made during construction that are not in 

compliance with the approved construction documents shall be resubmitted for approval as an 

amended set of construction documents. 

105.5 Retention of construction documents. One set of approved construction documents 

shall be retained by the building official for a period of not less than that dictated by OAR 166-

150-0020 where a county has jurisdiction, OAR 166-200-0025 where a city has jurisdiction and 

OAR 166-300 et al for the jurisdictions where the State of Oregon has jurisdiction. One set of 

approved plans and specifications shall be returned to the applicant, and said set shall be kept 

on the site of the building or work at all times during which the work authorized thereby is in 

progress. The building official shall maintain a permanent record of all permits issued in flood 

hazard areas, including copies of inspection reports and certifications required in Section 1612. 

 

 

SECTION 106 

 

TEMPORARY STRUCTURES AND USES 
 

 

106.1 General. The building official is authorized to issue a permit for temporary structures 

and temporary uses. Such permits shall be limited as to time of service, but shall not be 

permitted for more than 180 days. The building official is authorized to grant extensions for 

demonstrated cause. 

 

106.2 Conformance. Temporary structures and uses shall conform to the structural strength, 

and fire safety requirements of this code as necessary to ensure public health, safety and 

general welfare. 

 

106.3 Termination of approval. The building official is authorized to terminate such permit 

for a temporary structure or use and to order the temporary structure or use to be discontinued. 

 

 

 

 



Revised 4/5/10 

13 

 

SECTION 107 
 

FEES 

 

Note: Unless amended locally by a municipality under the author- 

Ity of ORS 455.040 and 455-210, the requirements of Section 107 apply. 

 

107.1 Payment of fees. A permit shall not be valid until the fees prescribed by law have been 

paid, nor shall an amendment to a permit be released until the additional fee, if any, has been 

paid. 

 

107.2 Schedule of permit fees. A fee for each permit shall be paid as required, in accordance 

with the schedule as established by the applicable governing authority under authority of ORS 

455.020 and 455.210. 

 

455.210. (1) Fees shall be prescribed as required by ORS 

455.020 for plan review and permits issued by the Department 

of Consumer and Business Services for the construction, 

reconstruction, alteration and repair of prefabricated structures 

and of buildings and other structures and the installation of 

mechanical heating and ventilating devices and equipment. 

The fees may not exceed 130 percent of the fee schedule 

printed in the “Uniform Building Code,” 1979 Edition, and in 

the “Uniform Mechanical Code,” 1979 Edition, both published 

by the International Conference of Building Officials. Fees are 

not effective until approved by the Oregon Department of 

Administrative Services. 

 (2) Notwithstanding subsection (1) of this section, the 

maximum fee the Director of the Department of Consumer and 

Business Services may prescribe for a limited plan review for 

fire and life safety as required under ORS 479.155 shall be 40 

percent of the prescribed permit fee. 

 (3)(a) A municipality may adopt by ordinance or regulation 

such fees as may be necessary and reasonable to provide for 

the administration and enforcement of any specialty code or 

codes for which the municipality has assumed responsibility 

under ORS 455.148 or 455.150. A municipality shall give the 

director notice of the proposed adoption of a new or increased 

fee under this subsection. The municipality shall give the 

notice to the director at the time the municipality provides the 

opportunity for public comment under ORS 294.160 regarding 

the fee or, if the proposed fee is contained in an estimate of 

municipal budget resources, at the time notice of the last 

budget meeting is published in a newspaper under ORS 

294.401. 

 (b) Ten or more persons or an association with 10 or more 



Revised 4/5/10 

14 

 

members may appeal the adoption of a fee described in this 

subsection to the Director of the Department of Consumer and 

Business Services. The persons or association must file the 

appeal no later than 60 days after the director receives notice 

of the proposed adoption of the fee from the municipality 

under paragraph (a) of this subsection. However, if the 

municipality failed to give notice to the director, an appeal 

may be filed with the director within one year after adoption of 

the new or increased fee. Upon receiving a timely appeal, the 

director shall, after notice to affected parties and hearing, 

review the municipality’s fee adoption process and the costs of 

administering and enforcing the specialty code or codes 

referred to in paragraph (a) of this subsection. The director 

shall approve the fee if the director feels the fee is necessary 

and reasonable. If the director does not approve the fee upon 

appeal, the fee is not effective. The appeal process provided in 

this paragraph does not apply to fees that have been submitted 

for a vote and approved by a majority of the electors voting on 

the question. 

 (c) Fees collected by a municipality under this subsection 

shall be used for the administration and enforcement of a 

building inspection program for which the municipality has 

assumed responsibility under ORS 455.148 or 455.150. 

 (d) For purposes of paragraph (b) of this subsection, in 

determining whether a fee is reasonable the director shall 

consider whether: 

 (A) The fee is the same amount as or closely approximates 

the amount of the fee charged by other municipalities of a 

similar size and geographic location for the same level of 

service; 

 (B) The fee is calculated with the same or a similar 

calculation method as the fee charged by other municipalities 

for the same service; 

 (C) The fee is the same type as the fee charged by other 

municipalities for the same level of service; and 

 (D) The municipality, in adopting the fee, complied with 

ORS 294.160, 294.361 and 294.401 and this section and 

standards adopted by the director under ORS 455.148 (11) or 

455.150 (11). 

 (4) Notwithstanding any other provision of this chapter: 

 (a) For the purpose of partially defraying state 

administrative costs, there is imposed a surcharge in the 

amount of four percent of the total permit fees or, if the 

applicant chooses to pay an hourly rate instead of purchasing a 

permit, four percent of the total hourly charges collected. 

 (b) For the purpose of partially defraying state inspection 



Revised 4/5/10 

15 

 

costs, there is imposed a surcharge in the amount of two 

percent of the total permit fees or, if the applicant chooses to 

pay an hourly rate instead of purchasing a permit, two percent 

of the total hourly charges collected. 

 (c) For the purpose of defraying the cost of administering 

and enforcing the state building code, there is imposed a 

surcharge on permit fees and on hourly charges collected 

instead of permit fees. The surcharge may not exceed one 

percent of the total permit fees or, if the applicant chooses to 

pay an hourly rate instead of purchasing a permit, one percent 

of the total hourly charges collected. 

 (5) Municipalities shall collect and remit surcharges 

imposed under subsection (4) of this section to the director as 

provided in ORS 455.220. 

 (6) The director shall adopt administrative rules to allow 

reduced fees for review of plans that have been previously 

reviewed. 

 

 

107.3 Plan review fees 

 

107.3.1 Building permit valuations. 

1. Permits issued for installations that comply with 304.9 and 305.4, will be charged a 

flat fee that includes permit review in accordance with OAR 918-050-XXXX. 

2. All other installations shall be based on the value of the system following the 

methodology set out in OAR 918-050-XXXX. 

 

107.4 Work commencing before permit issuance. Any person who commences any work on 

a, PV installation or a PV support structure, system before obtaining the necessary permits shall 

be subject to an investigation fee equal to the permit fee that shall be in addition to the required 

permit fees. 

 

 Exception: Work as permitted in Section 104.2.1 

 

107.5 Related fees. The payment of the fee for the construction, or alteration, for work done in 

connection to or concurrently with the work authorized by a permit shall not relieve the 

applicant or holder of the permit from the payment of other fees that are prescribed by law. 

 

107.6 Refunds. The building official is authorized to establish a refund policy. 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 



Revised 4/5/10 

16 

 

SECTION 108 
 

INSPECTIONS 

 

108.1 General. Construction or work for which a permit is required shall be subject to 

inspection by the building official and such construction or work shall remain accessible and 

exposed for inspection purposes until approved. Approval as a result of an inspection shall not 

be construed to be an approval of a violation of the provisions of this code or of other laws or 

ordinances of the jurisdiction. Inspections presuming to give authority to violate or cancel the 

provisions of this code or of other laws or ordinances of the jurisdiction shall not be valid. It 

shall be the duty of the permit applicant to cause the work to remain accessible and exposed for 

inspection purposes. Neither the building official nor the jurisdiction shall be liable for expense 

entailed in the removal or replacement of any material required to allow inspection. 

 

108.2 Preliminary inspection. Before issuing a permit, the building official is authorized to 

examine or cause to be examined buildings, structures and sites for which an application has 

been filed. 

 

108.3 Required inspections. The building official, upon notification, shall make the 

inspections set forth in Sections 

110.3.1 through 110.3.10. 

 

108.3.1 Ground Mounted Footing and foundation inspection. Footing and 

foundation inspections shall be made after excavations for footings are complete and 

any required reinforcing steel is in place. For concrete foundations, any required forms 

shall be in place prior to inspection. Materials for the foundation shall be on the job, 

except where concrete is ready mixed in accordance with ASTM C 94, the concrete 

need not be on the job. 

 

108.3.2 Mounting inspection. Inspection shall be made of the attachment of modules 

to racking or structural supports and the attachment of components to the structure. 

 

108.3.3 Electrical inspection. Inspection of electrical components of a PV system shall 

be conducted in accordance with the requirements of OAR 918-271. 

 

108.3.4 Lowest equipment elevation. In flood hazard areas, the elevation certification 

required in OSSC Section 1612.5 shall be submitted to the building official. 

 

108.3.5 Other inspections. In addition to the inspections specified above, the building 

official is authorized to make or require other inspections of any construction work to 

ascertain compliance with the provisions of this code and other laws that are enforced 

by the department of building safety. 

 

108.3.6 Special inspections. For special inspections, see  

Section OSSC 1704. 

 



Revised 4/5/10 

17 

 

108.3.7 Final inspection. The final inspection shall be made after all work required by 

the building permit is completed. 

 

108.4 Inspection agencies. The building official is authorized to accept reports of approved 

inspection agencies, provided such agencies satisfy the requirements as to qualifications and 

reliability. 

 

108.5 Inspection requests. It shall be the duty of the holder of the building permit or their duly 

authorized agent to notify the building official when work is ready for inspection. It shall be the 

duty of the permit holder to provide access to and means for inspections of such work that are 

required by this code. 

 

108.6 Approval required. Work shall not be done beyond the point indicated in each 

successive inspection without first obtaining the approval of the building official. The building 

official, upon notification, shall make the requested inspections and shall either indicate the 

portion of the construction that is satisfactory as completed, or notify the permit holder or his or 

her agent wherein the same fails to comply with this code. Any portions that do not comply 

shall be corrected and such portion shall not be covered or concealed until authorized by the 

building official. 

 

 

SECTION 109 
 

BOARD OF APPEALS 

 

109.1 General. In order to hear and decide appeals of orders, decisions or determinations made 

by the building official relative to the application and interpretation of this code the local 

jurisdiction shall establish an appeals procedure. 

 

109.2 Limitations on authority. An application for appeal shall be based on a claim that the 

true intent of this code or the rules legally adopted thereunder have been incorrectly interpreted, 

the provisions of this code do not fully apply or an equally good or better form of construction 

is proposed. An appeals board, when appointed, shall have no authority to waive requirements 

of this code. 

 

109.4 Appeal of decisions of building official. ORS 455.475 provides an alternative appeals 

process to that set forth by the local municipality. 

 

455.475 Appeal of decision of building official. A person 

aggrieved by a decision made by a building official under 

authority established pursuant to ORS 455.148, 455.150 or 

455.467 may appeal the decision. The following apply to an 

appeal under this section: 

 (1) An appeal under this section shall be made first to the 

appropriate specialty code chief inspector of the Department 

of Consumer and Business Services. The decision of the 



Revised 4/5/10 

18 

 

department chief inspector may be appealed to the appropriate 

advisory board. The decision of the advisory board may only 

be appealed to the Director of the Department of Consumer 

and Business Services if codes in addition to the applicable 

specialty code are at issue. 

 (2) If the appropriate advisory board determines that a 

decision by the department chief inspector is a major code 

interpretation, then the inspector shall distribute the decision 

in writing to all applicable specialty code public and private 

inspection authorities in the state. The decision shall be 

distributed within 60 days after the board’s determination, and 

there shall be no charge for the distribution of the decision. 

As used in this subsection, a “major code interpretation” 

means a code interpretation decision that affects or may affect 

more than one job site or more than one inspection 

jurisdiction. 

 (3) If an appeal is made under this section, an 

inspection authority shall extend the plan review deadline by 

the number of days it takes for a final decision to be issued for 

the appeal. 

 

 

SECTION 110 
 

VIOLATIONS 

 

110.1 Prohibited acts. Prohibited acts are as described in ORS 455.450. 

 

455.450 Prohibited acts. A person may not: 

 (1) Violate, or procure or assist in the violation of, any 

final order of the Director of the Department of Consumer and 

Business Services, an advisory board, a state administrative 

officer or any local appeals board, building official or 

inspector, concerning the application of the state building code 

in a particular case or concerning a license, certificate, 

registration or other authorization. 

 (2) Engage in, or procure or assist any other person to 

engage in, any conduct or activity for which a permit, label, 

license, certificate, registration or other formal authorization is 

required by any specialty code, any provision of ORS 446.003 

to 446.200, 446.225 to 446.285, 446.395 to 446.420, 446.566 

to 446.646, 446.666 to 446.746, 479.510 to 479.945, 479.950 

and 480.510 to 480.670, this chapter or ORS chapter 447, 460 

or 693, or any rule adopted or order issued for the 

administration and enforcement of those provisions, without 

first having obtained such permit, label, license, certificate, 



Revised 4/5/10 

19 

 

registration or other formal authorization. 

 (3) Violate, or procure or assist in the violation of, any 

standard, specification, requirement, prohibition or other 

technical provision set forth in the state building code or an 

applicable local building code or in any rule or order of the 

Department of Consumer and Business Services, an advisory 

board, a local governing body or local building official. 

 

110.2 Notice of violation. The building official is authorized to serve a notice of violation or 

order on the person responsible for the erection, construction, alteration, extension, repair, 

moving, removal, demolition or occupancy of a building or structure in violation of the 

provisions of this code, or in violation of a permit or certificate issued under the provisions of 

this code. Such order shall direct the discontinuance of the illegal action or condition and the 

abatement of the violation. 

 

110.3 Prosecution of violation. If the notice of violation is not complied with promptly, the 

building official is authorized to request the legal counsel of the jurisdiction to institute the 

appropriate proceeding at law or in equity to restrain, correct or abate such violation, or to 

require the removal or termination of the unlawful occupancy of the building or structure in 

violation of the provisions of this code or of the order or direction made pursuant thereto. 

 

110.4 Violation penalties. Any person who violates a provision of this code or fails to comply 

with any of the requirements thereof or who erects, constructs, alters or repairs a building or 

structure in violation of the approved construction documents or directive of the building 

official, or of a permit or certificate issued under the provisions of this code, shall be subject to 

penalties as prescribed by law. 

 

110.5 Penalties. Penalties for violations are prescribed in ORS 455.895 or as adopted by the 

municipality having authority. 

Local authority to levy penalties is limited to violations of code Application only. 

 

455.895 Civil penalties. (1)(a) The State Plumbing Board may 

impose a civil penalty against a person as provided under ORS 

447.992 and 693.992. Amounts recovered under this paragraph 

are subject to ORS 693.165. 

 (b) The Electrical and Elevator Board may impose a civil 

penalty against a person as provided under ORS 479.995. 

Amounts recovered under this paragraph are subject to ORS 

479.850. 

 (c) The Board of Boiler Rules may impose a civil penalty 

against a person as provided under ORS 480.670. Amounts 

recovered under this paragraph are subject to ORS 480.670. 

 (2) The Director of the Department of Consumer and 

Business Services, in consultation with the appropriate board, 

if any, may impose a civil penalty against any person who 

violates any provision of ORS 446.003 to 446.200, 446.225 to 



Revised 4/5/10 

20 

 

446.285, 446.395 to 446.420, 446.566 to 446.646, 446.666 to 

446.746, 479.510 to 479.945, 479.950 and 480.510 to 480.670 

and this chapter and ORS chapters 447, 460 and 693, or any 

rule adopted or order issued for the administration and 

enforcement of those provisions. Except as provided in 

subsections (3), (4) and (9) of this section or ORS 446.995, a 

civil penalty imposed under this section must be in an amount 

determined by the appropriate board or the director of not 

more than $5,000 for each offense or, in the case of a 

continuing offense, not more than $1,000 for each day of the 

offense. 

 (3) Each violation of ORS 446.003 to 446.200 or 446.225 

to 446.285, or any rule or order issued thereunder, constitutes a 

separate violation with respect to each manufactured structure 

or with respect to each failure or refusal to allow or perform an 

act required thereby, except that the maximum civil penalty 

may not exceed $1 million for any related series of violations 

occurring within one year from the date of the first violation. 

 (4) The director may impose a civil penalty of not more 

than $25,000 against a public body responsible for 

administering and enforcing a building inspection program. As 

used in this subsection, “public body” has the meaning given 

that term in ORS 174.109. 

 (5) The maximum penalty established by this section for a 

violation may be imposed only upon a finding that the person 

has engaged in a pattern of violations. The Department of 

Consumer and Business Services, by rule, shall define what 

constitutes a pattern of violations. Except as provided in 

subsections (1) and (10) of this section, moneys received from 

any civil penalty under this section are appropriated 

continuously for and shall be used by the director for 

enforcement and administration of provisions and rules 

described in subsection (2) of this section. 

 (6) Civil penalties under this section shall be imposed as 

provided in ORS 183.745. 

 (7) A civil penalty imposed under this section may be 

remitted or reduced upon such terms and conditions as the 

director or the appropriate board considers proper and 

consistent with the public health and safety. In any judicial 

review of a civil penalty imposed under this section, the court 

may, in its discretion, reduce the penalty. 

 (8) Any officer, director, shareholder or agent of a 

corporation, or member or agent of a partnership or 

association, who personally participates in or is an accessory to 

any violation by the partnership, association or corporation of 

a provision or rule described in subsection (2) of this section is 



Revised 4/5/10 

21 

 

subject to the penalties prescribed in this section. 

 (9) In addition to the civil penalty set forth in subsection 

(1) or (2) of this section, any person who violates a provision 

or rule described in subsection (2) of this section may be 

required by the director or the appropriate board to forfeit and 

pay to the General Fund of the State Treasury a civil penalty in 

an amount determined by the director or board that shall not 

exceed five times the amount by which such person profited in 

any transaction that violates a provision or rule described in 

subsection (2) of this section. 

 (10) If a civil penalty is imposed for a violation of a 

provision of ORS 446.566 to 446.646 and the violation relates 

to a filing or failure to file with a county assessor functioning 

as agent of the department, the department, after deducting an 

amount equal to the department’s procedural, collection and 

other related costs and expenses, shall forward one-half of the 

remaining civil penalty amount to the county in which the 

manufactured structure is located at the time of the violation. 

 

 

SECTION 111 
 

STOP WORK ORDER 

 

111.1 Authority. Whenever the building official finds any work regulated by this code being 

performed in a manner either contrary to the provisions of this code or dangerous or unsafe, the 

building official is authorized to issue a stop work order. 

 

111.2 Issuance. The stop work order shall be in writing and shall be given to the owner of the 

property involved, or to the owner’s agent, or to the person doing the work. Upon issuance of a 

stop work order, the cited work shall immediately cease. The stop work order shall state the 

reason for the order, and the conditions under which the cited work will be permitted to resume. 

 

111.3 Unlawful continuance. Any person who shall continue any work after having been 

served with a stop work order, except such work as that person is directed to perform to remove 

a violation or unsafe condition, shall be subject to penalties as prescribed by law. 


